

# EXHIBIT D

IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT  
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF FLORIDA  
MIAMI DIVISION

DR. BERND WOLLSCHLAEGER, et al., Plaintiffs,

v.

FRANK FARMER, et al., Defendants.

CASE NO.: 1:11-CV-22026-COOKE/TURNOFF

## Phase 1 - Assembling the Complaint

05/26/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Discuss filing with B. Manheim (.25); Review SD Fla rules and determine filing requirements for Complaint. (1.0)	1.25	150	\$187.50
05/27/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Conduct research into SD Fla local court rules on pro hac motions, Motions for PI and filing complaints.	1.00	150	\$150.00
<b>Phase 1 Totals</b>				<b>2.25</b>		<b>\$337.50</b>

05/11/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conference call with Florida/Brady case team (.5) and call with A.Ripa regarding strategy for complaint (.5)	1.00	350	\$350.00
05/17/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Read additional MD-related First Amendment cases	0.50	350	\$175.00
05/21/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Continued reading MD-related First Amendment cases.	0.75	350	\$262.50
05/23/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Concluded revising complaint based on suggestions from B. Manheim and A. Ripa (3.5) as well as research on gun-incident information and facts regarding preventative care (4.25).	7.75	350	\$2,712.50
05/24/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Prepared clean version of draft complaint for circulation to co-counsel and e-mail correspondence with team and co-counsel regarding revisions to same.	4.50	350	\$1,575.00
05/25/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Revised: E-mails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and A.Ripa conveying research on and analysis of issues related to facial challenges and standing (1.25); research on and analysis of 11th Circuit law regarding the same (9.50).	10.75	350	\$3,762.50
05/26/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding local counsel and colleagues admitted to S.D. Fla..	0.50	350	\$175.00
05/27/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Research (3.5) and e-mails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, S. Lemmon, and A.Ripa regarding standing issues and also preliminary injunction standards (1.25).	4.75	350	\$1,662.50
06/01/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Concluded drafting memorandum regarding impact of Rust v. Sullivan on First Amendment claim.	0.75	350	\$262.50
06/02/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed and commented on several draft declarations for organizational plaintiffs.	5.00	350	\$1,750.00
06/03/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with B.Manheim and later A. Ripa regarding additional revisions to complaint (0.5); numerous e-mails to/from entire R&G team regarding preparations for conference call with clients and additional unresolved factual matters (1.0) followed by conference call with clients (0.5)	2.00	350	\$700.00
06/04/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Numerous e-mails to/from/among D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and clients regarding clients' proposed changes to draft complaint (.75); conferred twice with Dr. Louis St. Petery regarding revisions to complaint (.75) and worked with the Ropes team to integrate suggestions (.75)	2.25	350	\$787.50
06/05/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Revised complaint to reflect comments by E.Mullins, B.Wollschlaeger, and St. Petery	1.25	350	\$437.50
<b>Phase 1 Totals</b>				<b>41.75</b>		<b>\$14,612.50</b>

05/11/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with B. Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier, A. Ripa, and R. Dugas regarding Brady Campaign challenge to Florida gun law.	1.00	350	\$350.00
05/11/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed background materials on the case and the history of the law	0.50	350	\$175.00
05/12/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review background materials on HB 155 and potential challenge to law (0.75), emails with team regarding introductory meeting and strategy (0.25), and review and prepare questions for physician declarants (1.5).	2.50	350	\$875.00
05/12/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Conference call with Allison Finley, the Executive Director of the Florida Pediatric Society aka Florida Chapter of the AAP, re: litigation strategy and physician plaintiffs.	0.50	350	\$175.00
05/13/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Draft outline of questions for physician declarants (1.25) and emails with R. Dugas regarding same (.25)	1.50	350	\$525.00

05/16/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with R. Dugas (Ropes & Gray colleague) and Allison Finley (Florida Chapter of AAP) regarding plaintiffs (.5). Draft outline of questions for physician declarants (3.5). Prepare template for S.D. Fla. declaration papers (1.0).	5.00		
					350	\$1,750.00
05/16/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Background reading on statute and analysis of provisions of statute for purposes of physician interviews	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
05/17/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review and comment on draft complaint in preparation for team meeting	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
06/03/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review draft complaint.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
	<b>Phase 1 Totals</b>			<b>15.50</b>		<b>\$5,425.00</b>

05/11/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with Bruce Manheim and Brady Center attorneys regarding draft complaint and papers in support for preliminary injunction followed by meeting with Ms. Dewar, Mr. Dugas, Ms. Goetz, and Mr. Ripa regarding preparation of complaint and papers in support of injunction	1.50		
					450	\$675.00
05/12/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Strategize regarding First Amendment challenge to gag rule	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/13/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review template for declarant interviews	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/17/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with co-counsel from Brady Center regarding preparation of complaint (0.5) followed by review of correspondence with Brady Center regarding declarations (0.5) and consult with team regarding organizational plaintiffs (1.0)	2.00		
					450	\$900.00
05/18/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Consultation with team regarding draft complaint and organizational plaintiffs.	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
05/19/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise draft complaint.	4.25		
					450	\$1,912.50
05/20/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Analyze standing requirements for First Amendment challenge.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/23/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review research prepared by Brady Center.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/24/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft physician declarations (.5) and confer with Mr. Ripa and Mr. Dugas regarding standard for establishing standing to seek injunction regarding speech restricting legislation. (.25)	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
05/25/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with co-counsel at Brady regarding complaint.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/25/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise draft complaint and draft declarations.	1.25		
					450	\$562.50
05/26/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Confer with Mr. Manheim and Ms. Dewar regarding necessary steps to prepare for filing of complaint and preliminary injunction motion.	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
05/26/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft physician declaration (.5) and confer with Ms. Dewar re preliminary injunction motion (.25).	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
05/26/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review further revised version of draft complaint.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/27/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review revisions to draft complaint	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
05/31/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Discussion with Bruce Manheim regarding filing logistics and timing of preliminary injunction motion.	0.25		
					450	\$112.50
06/02/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft organizational declarations.	1.25		
					450	\$562.50
06/02/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Team meeting to discuss declarations and complaint.	1.25		
					450	\$562.50
06/03/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and revise complaint (2.75). Circulate to clients for comment (.25).	0.25		
					450	\$112.50
06/03/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and revise complaint. Circulate to clients for comment.	3.00		
					450	\$1,350.00
06/03/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Teleconference with clients to discuss complaint and preliminary injunction and declarations in support.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
06/05/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise draft complaint and physician declarations.	1.50		
					450	\$675.00
06/05/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with Dr. Wollschlaeger regarding serving as lead plaintiff in lawsuit and declaration in support.	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
06/06/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise draft complaint and declarations.	4.00		
					450	\$1,800.00
06/06/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review revisions of local counsel to draft complaint.	0.25		
					450	\$112.50
06/08/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with counsel to Governor regarding proper defendant. (.5) Consultation with team regarding possible amendment of complaint to add new plaintiffs and defendants and/or drop defendants. (.75) Review of research regarding head of agency suits. (1.75)	3.00		
					450	\$1,350.00
	<b>Phase 1 Totals</b>			<b>32.00</b>		<b>\$14,400.00</b>

05/27/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Researched case law and drafted memorandum regarding vagueness and overbreadth challenges under the First Amendment.	4.50		
					350	\$1,575.00
05/28/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Researched whether gun owners are required to disclose or register ownership of firearms to federal or state government.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
<b>Phase 1 Totals</b>				<b>4.50</b>		<b>\$1,575.00</b>

05/18/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Call with E. Dewar regarding organization versus individual harms to doctors.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
05/19/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Call with Brady intern and R. Dugas regarding physician interviews (.5)	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
05/19/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft template physician declaration for R. Dugas (3.0). Discuss requirements for organizational plaintiffs with B. Dewar, R. Dugas, and A. Ripa. (.75)	3.75		
					350	\$1,312.50
05/23/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Interview Dr. Wollschlaeger regarding his views of gun safety counseling and HB 155 (2.0) and review notes and declarations from interviews conducted by Brady interns (2.0).	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
05/24/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft summaries of 5 witness interviews conducted by Brady.	5.00		
					350	\$1,750.00
05/25/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research and draft analysis of third party standing (10), discuss the same with A. Ripa and B.Dewar (.75)	10.75		
					350	\$3,762.50
05/26/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Calls with B. Dewar and A. Ripa regarding additional research questions and status of declarations (1.0); revise Wollschlaeger declaration to reflect B. Dewar's suggestions regarding hypothetical example of chill and issue of consent for recording gun information in medical chart (2.25)	3.25		
					350	\$1,137.50
05/26/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research whether injury to ability to pursue one's profession is sufficient for standing, what constitutes an imminent injury for standing purposes, and whether the Florida Medical Board issues advisory opinions.	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00
05/30/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Email Dr. Drusano regarding setting up an interview and R. Dugas regarding status of physician interviews.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
06/02/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Interview with Dr. Cava regarding his views on HB 155 (2.0); send follow-up emails to physician (1.0)	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
06/03/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research service of process issue and discuss with team and local counsel.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
<b>Phase 1 Totals</b>				<b>35.00</b>		<b>\$12,250.00</b>

05/16/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review draft complaint for case developed by team	1.00	450	\$450.00
05/17/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up with J. Lowy and team regarding case status and in particular follow up on complaint and declarations being prepared by team	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
05/18/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Call with representatives from the American College of Physicians regarding challenge to Fla law.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
05/18/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up with J. Lowy and team regarding status of case.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/19/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence relating to prep of declarations, etc (.25) followed by reviewing draft complaint (1.75) and follow up via email correspondence with team and clients (.25).	2.25		
					450	\$1,012.50
05/23/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review of draft PI motion, complaint, declarations	1.00	450	\$450.00
05/24/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with co-counsel re case and next steps.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/25/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Conference call with co-counsel for Brady and D. Hallward-Drimeier about case.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
05/25/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review papers (.75); draft letter to governor (.5); follow up email correspondence (.25)	1.50		
					450	\$675.00
05/26/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Draft demand/notice letter to Governor Scott; circulate to group for review and approval.	2.50		
					450	\$1,125.00

05/26/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with team regarding Governor Scott letter.	0.50	450	\$225.00
05/26/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with B. Dewar and D. Hallward-Driemer regarding next steps in case.	0.50	450	\$225.00
05/27/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Finalize letter to Gov. Scott (.75); email correspondence with team regarding local counsel (.75); telephone conference with K. Crumbley regarding AAP position (1.0)	2.50	450	\$1,125.00
05/27/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone call with H. Lucas regarding Florida Ped. case and filings as local counsel.	0.75	450	\$337.50
05/27/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with H. Lucas regarding local counsel, etc.	0.50	450	\$225.00
<b>Phase 1 Totals</b>				<b>16.50</b>		<b>\$7,425.00</b>

05/05/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research first amendment case law in furtherance of writing complaint	2.25	350	\$787.50
05/06/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research first amendment case law and begin drafting complaint	6.75	350	\$2,362.50
05/09/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research first amendment case law and continue drafting complaint	5.00	350	\$1,750.00
05/10/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research first amendment case law and continue drafting complaint	6.00	350	\$2,100.00
05/11/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research first amendment case law and continue drafting complaint	7.00	350	\$2,450.00
05/12/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research first amendment case law and continue drafting in furtherance of writing complaint	10.50	350	\$3,675.00
05/13/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research first amendment case law (3.5), coordinate with B. Dewar regarding filing of complaint (.25), perform revisions and edits in furtherance of writing complaint (1.25)	5.00	350	\$1,750.00
05/16/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise and edit the complaint	4.00	350	\$1,400.00
05/17/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise and edit the complaint (1.0), research law re: preliminary injunction and begin drafting the same (3.0), and participate in conference with case team re: next steps (1.0)	5.00	350	\$1,750.00
05/18/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Continue drafting complaint and coordinate with team re: venue	4.75	350	\$1,662.50
05/20/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Continue to revise and edit the complaint (4.0) and met with B.Manheim and B.Dewar re: revisions (.75); coordinate with team re: venue and proper plaintiffs (.25)	5.00	350	\$1,750.00
05/24/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Analyze facts gathered to be included in complaint; coordinate revisions of the same.	4.00	350	\$1,400.00
05/25/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research and draft analysis of third party standing (7.0), discuss the same with J.Lewis and B.Dewar (1.0)	8.00	350	\$2,800.00
06/03/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Confer with team re: next steps in revisions to complaint; effectuate the same; analyze documents for fact-citations in complaint	4.00	350	\$1,400.00
<b>Phase 1 Totals</b>				<b>77.25</b>		<b>\$27,037.50</b>

	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fee</b>
<b>Phase 1</b>	224.75	\$83,062.50

## Phase 2 - Preliminary Injunction Proceedings and Amended Complaint

06/20/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Discuss upcoming filing with team.	0.50	150	\$75.00
06/21/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Cite Check, Bluebook, proof and edit Preliminary Injunction brief.	4.25	150	\$637.50
06/22/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Cite Check, Bluebook, proof and edit Preliminary Injunction brief and declarations.	4.25	150	\$637.50
06/23/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Call local counsel to discuss filing (.5); prepare declarations for distribution and e-filing (1.75); enter edits into brief (.75)	3.00	150	\$450.00

07/08/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Review reply brief and discuss edits with B. Dewars	1.00	150	\$150.00
	<b>Phase 2 Totals</b>			<b>13.00</b>		<b>\$1,950.00</b>
05/17/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conference call and various e-mails with R&G team regarding plan for drafting PI papers, declarations and information necessary for PI.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
05/18/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with A. Ripa, M. Goetz, J. Lewis, and R. Dugas about additional research required for PI motion, including on issues of harm and organizational standing	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
05/18/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Researched and read First Amendment case law for PI motion	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
05/19/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Continued researching and reading First Amendment case law for PI motion (2.0); researched 1983 incorporation issue (1.5); responded to comments in, and implemented revisions to, D.Hallward-Driemeier draft (1.5).	5.00		
					350	\$1,750.00
05/19/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from M.Goetz, A.Ripa, R.Dugas, and J.Lewis regarding MDs' declarations (.25); conferred with A.Ripa regarding First Amendment issues (.75).	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
05/20/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Began drafting "likelihood of success on the merits" section of PI motion (5.0); conferred with B.Manheim and A.Ripa regarding revisions to complaint (.75); conferred further with A.Ripa regarding same and regarding P.I. papers (.25).	6.00		
					350	\$2,100.00
05/26/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Research regarding Florida medical professionals' disciplinary processes	7.25		
					350	\$2,537.50
05/26/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon regarding further research on preliminary injunction standard in Eleventh Circuit.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
05/28/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Researched related Florida gun laws for preliminary injunction motion (.5); researched Eleventh Circuit and Supreme Court cases on privacy interests (1.5); finished researching and drafting strict scrutiny section of motion for preliminary injunction (1.5).	3.50		
					350	\$1,225.00
05/29/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed S.Lemmon memorandum on vagueness and overbreadth (.25); researched further and drafted vagueness section of preliminary injunction motion (3.0); revised complaint to reflect research on vagueness claim (0.5).	3.75		
					350	\$1,312.50
05/30/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Revised and integrated background, injury, balance-of-harms, and public interest sections of preliminary injunction motion drafted by A.Ripa (5.0); researched and integrated cases on the right to receive information, the overbreadth doctrine, and the likelihood of success (3.0)	8.00		
					350	\$2,800.00
05/31/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with A.Ripa regarding impact of Rust v. Sullivan, overbreadth issue, and motion for preliminary injunction (.5); researched cases on Rust v. Sullivan issue (1.0); began drafting memorandum to D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding same (0.75).	2.25		
					350	\$787.50
06/02/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conference call with D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, R.Dugas, A.Ripa, and J.Lewis regarding case status, preliminary injunction motion, the complaint, and organizations' declarations.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
06/05/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with and drafted declaration for plaintiff T.Schechtman; conferred twice with J.Schaechter regarding case and declaration.	6.00		
					350	\$2,100.00
06/06/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Worked with D. Hallward-Driemeier, E.Mullins, T.Schechtman, and J.Schaechter, to conclude implementing final revisions to complaint and declarations.	8.00		
					350	\$2,800.00
06/08/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Drafted declaration for R. Gutierrez (4.5), revised draft FACP declaration and draft FAFP declaration (.5). E-mails to/from E.Mullins regarding attorney-client privilege issue (.5) and to/from entire R&G associate team regarding additional declarants and plaintiffs (.5)	6.00		
					350	\$2,100.00
06/09/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	With assistance from M. Goetz, revised draft Gutierrez, Herman and L.Goodman draft declaration (3.75); email to D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding declarants (.25)	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00

06/09/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from R.Straus-Furlong regarding MDs' response to law and evidence for PI motion (.5); revised second draft of motion for preliminary injunction to improve it and reflect factual developments (2.75)	3.25		350	\$1,137.50
06/11/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed C.Dulis research on Supremacy Clause issue; e-mail to R&G team regarding same;	0.50		350	\$175.00
06/11/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed draft Fox-Levine declaration (.25); e-mails to/from J.Lewis regarding same (.5)	0.75		350	\$262.50
06/12/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from R.Dugas regarding Welty interview and declaration (.10); emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier and R.Dugas regarding case status and timing (.15); e-mails to/from A.Ripa regarding edits to Gutierrez declaration and call (.25); e-mail to R.Gutierrez regarding call (.25).	0.75		350	\$262.50
06/14/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon and A.Ripa regarding additional research on Defendant Dudek's powers and revisions to complaint incorporating same.	2.00		350	\$700.00
06/14/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Prepared clean draft of amended complaint and redline for circulation to local counsel (.75); numerous e-mails to/from E.Mullins, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding complaint, revisions thereto, and strategy, particularly the discrimination provision (5.75).	6.50		350	\$2,275.00
06/15/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Concluded revising amended complaint for circulation to co-counsel (5.0) and drafted email to co-counsel explaining certain strategic changes for amended complaint (.5).	5.50		350	\$1,925.00
06/16/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Revised entire PI motion per specific comments and requests for global revisions from E.Mullins, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim (7.0); additional research regarding "privacy"-related First Amendment cases, "professional speech," public versus private speech distinction, and organizational standing for PI motion (5.0)	12.00		350	\$4,200.00
06/17/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conference call with clients regarding PI motion and next steps;	1.00		350	\$350.00
06/17/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Revised proposed order (.75); implemented numerous revisions to PI motion to incorporate additional substance regarding FAAP, AMA policies, and others (7.0); conferred with team regarding same (1.0); conferred with J.Schaechter regarding additional issue for declaration (1.0).	9.75		350	\$3,412.50
06/19/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Implemented proposed revisions by J.Schaechter to her declaration and further revised declaration (1.75); numerous e-mails to/from J.Schaechter regarding additional revisions to declaration and logistics for transmitting signed copy (.25); emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding Schaechter declaration (.25)	2.25		350	\$787.50
06/19/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Implemented revisions to PI motion regarding FACP public health stance (1.0); conferred with R.Dugas regarding additional revisions to implement in PI motion (.75); reviewed and further revised (.25)	2.00		350	\$700.00
06/20/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from E.Mullins regarding logistics for filing complaint and PI (.5); revised PI page by page to reduce length by 6 pages toward 20-page limit (8.0); conferred with A.Ripa regarding same (.25).	8.75		350	\$3,062.50
06/20/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from N.Han regarding research on penalties under the "failure to perform legal obligation" guideline (1.0); e-mail to entire R&G team regarding results of N.Han research (1.0); emails to/from S.Lemmon, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding impact of recently decided Supreme Court cases (1.0).	3.00		350	\$1,050.00
06/21/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	PI motion work: continued revising PI to reduce length to 20-page limit (3.0); conferred with A.Ripa regarding additional revisions to PI motion regarding the legislative history and to reduce it in length (1.0); e-mail to D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding legislative history issue (.5); conferred with S.Antzoulatos regarding cite-check of PI memorandum (.5)	5.00		350	\$1,750.00

06/23/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mail to D.Vice regarding Brady Center edits (.25); performed final reviews of and implemented final technical and substantive revisions to PI motion and amended complaint before filing (6.0); numerous e-mails to/from local counsel and S.Antzoulatos regarding exhibits and logistics for filing (.25); numerous e-mails to/from B.Manheim and D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding IMS v. Sorrell decision and related potential revisions to PI motion (1.5)	8.00		
					350	\$2,800.00
06/24/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding final revision to amended complaint (.25); implemented revision and sent to local counsel (.25)	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
06/24/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with D.Hallward-Driemeier and H.Lucas regarding proposed order, summonses, and logistics for and manner of filing complaint, motion, and declarations (1.0); e-mails to/from A.Ripa and J.Broxmeyer regarding proposed order (.25); revised draft proposed order (.5); implemented D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim edits to proposed order (.25)	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
06/29/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with J.Broxmeyer regarding preliminary results of research on professional speech issue.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
06/29/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from B.Manheim, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and J.Becker regarding floor debates and committee meeting hearings (.25); conferred with J.Broxmeyer regarding preliminary results of research on professional speech issue (.25).	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/05/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Read and analyzed State's and NRA's oppositions to PI (.5), and conferred with B.Manheim, D.Hallward-Driemeier, J. Borxmeyer and R&G team regarding strategy for PI reply brief. (.5)	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
07/05/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with J.Broxmeyer regarding professional speech arguments and outline of brief (1.0); reviewed transcribed portions of Senate floor debates in connection to same (3.0)	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00
07/07/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Revised injury, balance of interest, and public interest sections of brief and drafted response to constitutional balancing and hortatory language arguments.	8.00		
					350	\$2,800.00
07/08/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Revised PI motion and Manheim declaration per numerous edits from B.Manheim, E.Mullins, D.Vice, and D.Hallward-Driemeier.	9.75		
					350	\$3,412.50
<b>Phase 2 Totals</b>				<b>163.00</b>		<b>\$57,050.00</b>

06/06/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review and comment on draft declarations and related documents.	7.50		
					350	\$2,625.00
06/06/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Conference call with B. DeWar, R. Dugas, J. Lewis and S. Lemmon regarding complaint, declarations, and preliminary injunction papers. (.25) Review and comment on same. (.75)	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
06/07/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with R. Dugas, J. Lewis and B. DeWar regarding doctor declarations, organizational declarations, preliminary injunction papers, and ongoing issues.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
06/07/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review complaint for facts to support in declarations and review/analyze declarations, creating a chart of factual support.	9.50		
					350	\$3,325.00
06/08/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Participate in doctor interview of Dr. Lance Goodman (2.0); draft Goodman declaration and emails with J. Lewis regarding same (8.75)	10.75		
					350	\$3,762.50
06/10/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Interview doctors and prepare declarations (5.0). Emails with team regarding status of doctors and case strategy (.5). Revise organizational declarations and emails with team regarding same in response. (3.25)	8.75		
					350	\$3,062.50
06/11/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Work on physician declarations (3.0). Emails with team regarding declarations and PI. (.5)	3.50		
					350	\$1,225.00
06/13/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Draft and revise physician declarations (3.5), emails with Dr. Leland and Dr. Stewart (.25). Team meeting regarding amended complaint and preliminary injunction papers (1.0). Emails with team regarding declarations, amended complaint, and outstanding action items (.25). Discuss HIPAA issue. (.25)	5.25		
					350	\$1,837.50



06/14/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with team regarding declarations and amended complaint (.25). Confer with J. Lewis regarding plaintiff-MDs HIPAA obligations as related to case. (.25)	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
06/17/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with organizations regarding membership of plaintiffs and declarants (1.0). Review and finalize declarations (2.5). Confer with Dr. June Leland regarding declaration (0.5)	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00
06/18/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with team regarding Board of Medicine defendants and case developments.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
06/19/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Attention to physician declarations. (1.0) Emails with team regarding case. (.5)	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
06/20/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Attention to physician declarations. (3.0) Emails with team regarding PI motion (1.0). Confer with R. Dugas regarding declarations. (.5) Review and comment on PI motion. (1.0)	5.50		
					350	\$1,925.00
06/21/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review and finalize physician declarations (2.0). Emails with team regarding PI motion (.25). Edits to PI motion and First Amended Complaint (2.5).	4.75		
					350	\$1,662.50
07/05/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review and analyze preliminary injunction papers and draft counterarguments to state and NRA opposition briefs and emails with team regarding state's opposition arguments.	6.00		
					350	\$2,100.00
07/05/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Team meeting to discuss reply brief.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
07/06/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Research and draft vagueness section of reply brief (9.5) and conference and e-mails with team regarding same (.75).	10.25		
					350	\$3,587.50
07/07/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with team regarding cases for PI and emails from doctors regarding PI hearing and recent experiences.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/07/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review legislative history document.	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
07/08/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review PI motion and emails with team regarding same.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
	<b>Phase 2 Totals</b>			<b>84.25</b>		<b>\$29,487.50</b>

06/07/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with Ed Mullins, including attempt to reach Gov. Scott's counsel.	0.25		
					450	\$112.50
06/09/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Correspondence with clients regarding declarations in support of preliminary injunction.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
06/12/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft declaration of Dr. Gutierrez.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/13/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and provide comments on draft memorandum in support of preliminary injunction.	1.75		
					450	\$787.50
06/14/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review amended complaint.	2.75		
					450	\$1,237.50
06/14/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise preliminary injunction memorandum.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/15/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Discuss with Mr. Ripa enforcement responsibilities of each defendant vis-a-vis gag law. (.5) Review statutory and regulatory provisions relating to enforcement responsibilities. (1.25)	1.75		
					450	\$787.50
06/15/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Prepare for an participate in call with counsel for defendants about possible amended complaint adding and deleting parties. (.5) Follow up with associates regarding addition of Board of Medicine. (.5)	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/15/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review of declarations.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/16/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review legislative history.	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
06/16/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft declarations for Drs. Fox, King, Edwards, Goodman, and plaintiff organizations.	1.75		
					450	\$787.50
06/17/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with all plaintiffs to discuss developments in case and upcoming amended complaint and preliminary injunction motion.	1.25		
					450	\$562.50
06/18/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise memorandum in support of preliminary injunction.	7.25		
					450	\$3,262.50
06/19/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise memorandum in support of preliminary injunction.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
06/20/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise preliminary injunction motion.	4.00		
					450	\$1,800.00
06/21/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review revisions to amended complaint.	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
06/21/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise draft memorandum in support of PI.	5.25		
					450	\$2,362.50

06/22/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with Dr. Schaectman to discuss AMA resolution in support of litigation.	0.25	450	\$112.50
06/23/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Final review memorandum in support of preliminary injunction.	1.25	450	\$562.50
06/24/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Correspondence with counsel for defendants regarding PI motion and scheduling logistics.	1.25	450	\$562.50
06/24/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Final review for filing of PI motion filings.	0.75	450	\$337.50
06/24/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review motion for oral argument and proposed order re PI motion.	0.75	450	\$337.50
06/27/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Preparation for and participation in call with counsel for defendants regarding scheduling and proceedings in case.	1.00	450	\$450.00
06/28/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Discussions with Mr. Manheim and Ms. Dewar research in anticipation of reply brief in support of PI.	0.75	450	\$337.50
07/05/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with team to discuss reply to Florida and NRA briefs.	1.00	450	\$450.00
07/05/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review Florida and NRA briefs in response to motion for PI.	0.75	450	\$337.50
07/06/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Correspondence with co-counsel and counsel for the State regarding live testimony at preliminary injunction hearing.	0.25	450	\$112.50
07/06/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review briefs of State and NRA in opposition to PI motion. Prepare comments for reply.	1.25	450	\$562.50
07/07/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise reply to PI motion.	6.50	450	\$2,925.00
07/08/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call with Mr. Manheim, Ms. Dewar, and Mr. Dugas to discuss revised reply to PI motion.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/08/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise reply to PI motion.	3.75	450	\$1,687.50
07/10/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise response to motion to alter caption.	0.25	450	\$112.50
<b>Phase 2 Totals</b>				<b>52.75</b>		<b>\$23,737.50</b>

05/26/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research into and drafted portion describing legal standard for the four prongs required in a motion for preliminary injunction.	5.25	350	\$1,837.50
05/27/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Researched case law and drafted introductory paragraphs for Motion for Preliminary Injunction describing standards for elements of Preliminary Injunction test.	2.75	350	\$962.50
05/28/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Researched whether vagueness claims ever arise under the First Amendment and how standing/ripeness rules function for vagueness challenges.	2.00	350	\$700.00
06/06/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Read cases for memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction.	2.00	350	\$700.00
06/07/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research and edited memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction.	5.75	350	\$2,012.50
06/08/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction.	7.75	350	\$2,712.50
06/10/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Participated in conference call with B. Dewar and M. Goetz regarding adding new defendants to amended complaint.	0.25	350	\$87.50
06/12/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted paragraphs describing Board of Medicine defendants for amended complaint.	1.00	350	\$350.00
06/13/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Attended meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier, E. Dewar, J. Lewis, R. Dugas, M. Goetz, and A. Ripa to discuss steps needed to finalize complaint and motion for preliminary injunction.	1.00	350	\$350.00
06/13/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research into whether plaintiffs have standing to sue all defendants, including contacting Dr. Judy Schaechter to determine whether she works in a hospital.	1.75	350	\$612.50
06/13/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research to determine whether Florida Board of Medicine has General Counsel.	0.50	350	\$175.00
06/13/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research to ensure that named plaintiffs have standing to sue all defendants.	0.50	350	\$175.00

06/13/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited complaint including adding paragraphs describing named plaintiffs and defendants, updating caption, and other changes.	2.75		
					350	\$962.50
06/13/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with Bessie Dewar to finalize caption, make final edits to complaint.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
06/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Completed multiple edits to amended complaint, including incorporating comments by other attorneys, editing a defendant's job description, and adding information found in studies given to us by the Brady Center.	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00
06/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research and drafted memo with A. Ripa describing the defendants named in complaint and why they are proper defendants.	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
06/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Enter information into complaint regarding plaintiff Judith Schaechter and her ties to hospitals.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
06/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with E. Dewar to edit caption and descriptions of defendants in complaint.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
06/15/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Inserted comments by D. Hallward-Driemeier, B. Manheim, and E. Mullins into memorandum supporting application for preliminary injunction.	2.75		
					350	\$962.50
06/15/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed studies sent by Brady center for potential use in complaint.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
06/15/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted declaration for Dr. Katherine Welty.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
06/17/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Participated in conference call with Ropes & Gray team, Brady Center, and plaintiffs.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
06/20/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed recent Supreme Court opinions that address First Amendment issues to determine relevance to our case.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
06/20/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed declarations by plaintiffs and declarants to determine the frequency with which patients appreciated or rejected firearms counseling.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
06/21/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with E. Dewar and other associates on reviewing, editing brief and motion for preliminary injunction.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
06/22/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Review motion for preliminary injunction prior to filing.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
06/29/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research on the captive audience doctrine in First Amendment law to craft potential responses to NRA's Opposition to Motion for Preliminary Injunction.	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
06/30/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Researched First Amendment captive audience doctrine for discussion with B. Manheim.	6.75		
					350	\$2,362.50
07/01/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Discussed captive audience doctrine, ripeness, and other issues with B. Manheim, J. Lewis, D. Hallward-Driemeier, B. Dewar, and J. Broxmeyer.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
07/01/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Read cases on First Amendment's captive audience doctrine.	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00
07/05/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research to determine the circumstances under which Florida doctors are entitled to terminate doctor-patient relationships.	1.75		
					350	\$612.50
07/05/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted response to argument regarding the First Amendment captive audience doctrine.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
07/05/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed defendants' opposition to motion for preliminary injunction.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
07/05/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed National Rifle Association's opposition to motion for preliminary injunction.	2.25		
					350	\$787.50
07/06/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research to determine whether Florida statutes or regulations affecting physicians use the term "should" in a context that implies a mandatory requirement.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/06/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted response to argument regarding the First Amendment captive audience doctrine.	4.75		
					350	\$1,662.50
07/06/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed National Rifle Association's opposition to motion for preliminary injunction.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/07/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research to determine whether courts have concluded that "should" clauses in statutes impose mandatory requirements.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00

07/07/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research to determine whether Florida statutes or regulations affecting physicians use the term "should" in a context that implies a mandatory requirement.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/08/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Phone conference with B. Manheim, A. Ripa regarding plans for Reply to State's Motion to Revise Styling of Case (caption).	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/08/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Researched case law on Attorney General's duties, suits against officers in their official capacities in preparation of Reply to State's Motion to Revise Styling of Case (caption).	1.75		
					350	\$612.50
07/09/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted Reply to State's Motion for Order to Revise Styling (caption) of case.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
<b>Phase 2 Totals</b>				<b>85.50</b>		<b>\$29,925.00</b>

05/17/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Spoke with M. Goetz, A. Ripa, and R. Dugas to strategize about division of labor and to determine the research agenda for the preliminary injunction, including finding an overview of grounds for preliminary injunction, meet with R. Dugas to review research needed on necessary harms required under preliminary injunction standard.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
05/24/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft and revise declaration for Dr. Wollschlaeger based on interview notes.	1.25		
					350	\$437.50
06/03/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Call with Dr. Schaefer regarding revising her declaration, with Dr. Ramon-Coton regarding her views on HB 155 and setting up an interview, and with Ropes team and plaintiffs to discuss status of lawsuit.	3.25		
					350	\$1,137.50
06/07/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Call with Dr. Paredes regarding his practice of asking about firearms and his opinion on HB 155.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
06/07/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Revise declaration for Dr. Ramon-Coton and follow-up call with Dr. Ramon-Coton regarding same.	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00
06/07/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Review, comment and revise draft of FAAP organizational declaration.	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
06/07/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Review newspaper and internet articles concerning origins of the HB 155 bill, and background of similar bills in other states.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
06/08/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Send text of firearm bill to physicians and request copies of their CVs from potential interviewees (1.0). Correspondence with Dr. King, Dr. Fox, and Dr. Northrup regarding interviews (1.5); interview Dr. Goodman regarding the impact of HB 155 on his practice (2.0).	4.50		
					350	\$1,575.00
06/10/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Call with Dr. Fox re: revisions to declaration followed by interview with Dr. Fox (3.0); revise/draft Fox, and Edwards declaration (2.0). Conference calls with team to discuss timeline for filing amended complaint (1.0), followed by update to the physician spreadsheet (1.0).	6.00		
					350	\$2,100.00
06/11/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft emails to D. Hallward-Driemeier summarizing Goodman, Edwards, and Fox declarations (1.25). Draft sections of complaint describing the impact of the new law on Drs. Edwards and Fox's practices (1.0). Draft Dr. King declaration. (1.0)	3.25		
					350	\$1,137.50
06/12/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft Dr. King declaration.	2.25		
					350	\$787.50
06/13/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Left voicemail for Dr. Edwards regarding draft declaration (.25). Revise Dr. King declaration and email her requesting any comments (3.0). Draft paragraphs for S. Lemmon to use in shadow complaint regarding Drs. Edwards and Fox. (1.75)	5.00		
					350	\$1,750.00
06/13/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Meet with team to review items to be completed before filing amended complaint and preliminary injunction.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
06/14/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Discuss with M. Goetz and team whether defendants would be able to request patient medical records under HIPAA in relation to case (1.25); left voicemail to Dr. Fox regarding her questions about disclosure of patients' records under HIPAA and timing of discovery. (.25)	1.50		
					350	\$525.00

06/14/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research whether filing an application for preliminary injunction, motion for preliminary injunction, or temporary restraining order is the appropriate manner of seeking relief.	1.00		350	\$350.00
06/15/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Review draft of amended complaint and discuss with team whether to remove references to studies with questionable methodology from the complaint.	1.00		350	\$350.00
06/15/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Call and email Dr. Fox-Levine regarding number of patients that she has not discussed firearms with since HB 155 was passed, and review notes from Dr. Wollschlaeger interview to clarify whether or not he used a questionnaire with firearms questions on it.	1.00		350	\$350.00
06/16/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Make final revisions to declarations for Goodman, Fox, King, and Edwards, including updating caption and implementing D. Hallward-Driemeier's changes (1.5). Email and follow-up calls with doctors on signing copies of their declarations (1.0)	2.50		350	\$875.00
06/17/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Confirm with R. Dugas status of declarations for Goodman, King, Fox, and Edwards (.25). Call with Dr. King regarding revisions to declaration and revise King declaration (.5). Call Dr. Edwards to check on status of original and scanned versions of signature page (.25)	1.00		350	\$350.00
06/22/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Email doctors reminding them of confidential nature of non-public information imparted to them (.5). Review D. Vice's comments on amended complaint (.5). Research case history of Jacksonville case to determine appropriateness of citation for B. Dewar. (.5)	1.50		350	\$525.00
06/24/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Review proposed order and final versions of complaint.	0.25		350	\$87.50
06/27/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Email B. Dewar regarding reaching out to potential physician declarants for use in reply to defendant's opposition to motion for preliminary injunction.	0.50		350	\$175.00
06/29/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research 11th circuit caselaw on ripeness for B. Manheim and D. Hallward-Driemeier in preparation for challenge by defendants to ripeness of suit.	6.75		350	\$2,362.50
06/30/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research 11th circuit caselaw on ripeness for B. Manheim and D. Hallward-Driemeier in preparation for challenge by defendants to ripeness of suit and draft memo outlining research results.	11.25		350	\$3,937.50
07/01/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Conference call with B. Manheim and team regarding research in preparation for response to defendants' opposition to motion for preliminary injunction.	1.00		350	\$350.00
07/01/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research additional cases about the hardship prong of ripeness and add to draft outline of ripeness research.	2.00		350	\$700.00
07/05/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Review state's response and NRA's response in preparation for team meeting	3.75		350	\$1,312.50
07/05/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Meet with team to discuss defendant's opposition to our motion for a preliminary injunction and our strategy for drafting a reply brief.	1.00		350	\$350.00
07/06/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft paragraph for B. Dewar to insert into reply brief regarding standing analysis. (.5) Revise standing paragraph and add additional citations according to B. Dewar's suggestions. (1.5)	2.00		350	\$700.00
07/07/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft declaration for B. Manheim setting forth portions of legislative history cited by Defendants.	2.00		350	\$700.00
07/07/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Listen to recorded portions of senate and house floor debates to find portions of debates cited by defendants.	1.00		350	\$350.00
07/07/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research cases for B. Manheim dealing with tension between First Amendment free speech and Second Amendment privacy to address argument in defendants' response claiming that the gag law is a permissible balancing of conflicting constitutional rights and draft paragraph for reply brief adding same	4.75		350	\$1,662.50
07/08/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Coordinate with H. Lucas and E. Mullins to supervise filing of declaration, notice of conventional filing of CD, and actual CD containing audio recording of legislative history. (.5) Revise notice of conventional filing of CD. (.5)	1.00		350	\$350.00

07/08/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Revise declaration for B. Manheim describing incidents discussed in legislative history that were cited by defendants in their opposition.	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
07/19/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research uses of term "should" in other healthcare statutes with a disciplinary provision and cases holding that the presence of an exception to the rule means that the rule is mandatory.	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
<b>Phase 2 Totals</b>				<b>90.25</b>		<b>\$31,587.50</b>

06/06/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with team (.25) and review of declarations and complaint (.75).	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/15/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise PI memo for case.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/15/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with state attorneys regarding defendants in case.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
06/16/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on pleadings and declarations; email correspondence with clients.	1.50		
					450	\$675.00
06/17/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Redraft sections of PI memo.	3.00		
					450	\$1,350.00
06/17/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Teleconference with clients about next steps in case.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/20/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with clients.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/20/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise memo and amended complaint (.5); additional legal research (.5).	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/22/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with AMA and AAP, and T. Schectman.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
06/23/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review draft pleadings (.75), email correspondence (.25), teleconferences re finalization of amended complaint (1.0).	2.00		
					450	\$900.00
06/24/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with clients regarding PI filings.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
06/24/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Revise proposed order and pleading requesting a PI hearing (1.75); email correspondence with clients and counsel (.25); additional meetings regarding same (.75). Final review of pleadings before filing. (.25)	3.00		
					450	\$1,350.00
06/29/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up on various matters in case, including research in anticipation of PI opposition. (.75) Follow up on intervention issues (.75); review case law on "piggyback standing." (1.0)	2.50		
					450	\$1,125.00
07/01/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review memos prepared by J. Lewis and J. Broxmeyer regarding government arguments.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
07/01/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meeting with team regarding response to government and NRA opposition.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
07/05/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Conference call with local counsel regarding PI motion (.5); email correspondence regarding same (.25); follow up with team regarding same. (.25)	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
07/06/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Continued review and analysis of briefs from state and NRA.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
07/06/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review NRA and State briefs.	1.50		
					450	\$675.00
07/07/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Continue to review and revise brief; legal research.	1.50		
					450	\$675.00
07/08/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Correspondence with S. Lemmon and K. O'Connell regarding filings.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
07/08/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Substantial additional revisions to reply brief; coordinate filing.	3.00		
					450	\$1,350.00
<b>Phase 2 Totals</b>				<b>30.00</b>		<b>\$13,500.00</b>

05/19/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Continue to research law re: preliminary injunction and began drafting the same	2.75		
					350	\$962.50
05/23/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Analyze case law re: preliminary injunction motion and analyze facts gathered to be included in complaint; coordinate revisions of the same.	4.75		
					350	\$1,662.50
05/26/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Continue to analyze case law re: preliminary injunction motion and begin drafting the same	2.50		
					350	\$875.00
05/27/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Continue to analyze case law re: preliminary injunction motion and begin drafting the same	4.25		
					350	\$1,487.50
05/28/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft preliminary injunction motion, and then revise and edit the same	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00

05/29/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft preliminary injunction motion, revise and edit the same	7.50	350	\$2,625.00
06/01/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Confer with team re: next steps in case; analyze materials necessary for revisions of PI motion; coordinate the same	4.50	350	\$1,575.00
06/07/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Coordinate with team on plaintiffs, declarations (.25); legal research re: preliminary injunction (2.75)	3.00	350	\$1,050.00
06/08/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Legal research re: preliminary injunction	2.00	350	\$700.00
06/10/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Confer with team re: Dr. Gutierrez declaration revisions	0.50	350	\$175.00
06/11/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise Dr. Gutierrez declaration (3.0); analyze claims against agency responsible for health care facilities (1.5); confer with team on next steps (.5)	3.00	350	\$1,050.00
06/12/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Confer with team re: Dr. Gutierrez declaration revisions; effectuate the same	3.00	350	\$1,050.00
06/13/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise Dr. Gutierrez declaration (250); analyze claims against agency responsible for health care facilities (2.0); confer with team on next steps (.5).	5.00	350	\$1,750.00
06/14/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Analyze applicable Florida statutes and regulatory code provisions (2.0); coordinate revisions of documents to be filed with case team (.25); call with Dr. Gutierrez and D.Hallward-Dreimeier (.75)	3.00	350	\$1,050.00
06/15/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Coordinate revisions of documents to be filed with case team (.5); analyze proper defendants in preparation for 2pm call with state counsel and attended call (2.0)	2.50	350	\$875.00
06/16/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise and edit motion for preliminary injunction (1.75); analyze case law re: the same (1.75)	2.50	350	\$875.00
06/17/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Coordinate with team on declarations, captions, and other filing materials.	1.00	350	\$350.00
06/20/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise and edit motion for preliminary injunction; analyze case law re: the same.	3.25	350	\$1,137.50
06/21/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Review and edit preliminary injunction brief (3.0); confer with B.Dewar and D.Hallward-Dreimeier re: the same (.5)	3.50	350	\$1,225.00
06/24/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft and revise request for hearing; confer with team re: preliminary injunction edits and filing.	1.50	350	\$525.00
07/06/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Review team correspondence and emails on current issues in PI reply.	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/07/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Review team correspondence and emails on current issues in PI reply.	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/08/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Research, draft, and revise response to State's motion to change the case style (3.0); confer with B.Manheim, S.Lemmon, and B.Dewar re: the same (.5)	6.50	350	\$2,275.00
07/10/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft and revise response to State's motion to change case style	2.00	350	\$700.00
<b>Phase 2 Totals</b>				<b>73.50</b>		<b>\$25,725.00</b>

	Total Hours	Total Fee
<b>Phase 2</b>	592.25	\$212,962.50

**Phase 3 - Response to NRA's Motion to Intervene**

06/28/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Read Defendants' response to the NRA's motion to intervene and emails to/from E.Mullins, D.Hallward-Dreimeier, and B.Manheim regarding responding to same.	2.00	350	\$700.00
06/30/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Read Eleventh Circuit case law on mandatory and permissive intervention and drafted numerous e-mails and conferences to/from with B.Manheim, E.Mullins, and S.Lemmon regarding opposition to intervention.	5.00	350	\$1,750.00
07/01/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Readied opposition to NRA intervention for filing by various e-mail to team, a review of J.Lewis memorandum on justiciability issues, and a conference with with E.Mullins, N.Han, B. Manheim, D.Hallward-Dreimeier on legislative history/related issues.	3.50	350	\$1,225.00

07/06/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from B.Manheim regarding NRA reply in support of intervention (.5); read portions of legislative history cited in State brief and spoke to N. Han regarding further investigations required due to erroneous State citation (5.0); read and discussed S.Lemmon memorandum regarding captive audience issue (1.5)	10.00		
<b>Phase 3 Totals</b>				<b>20.50</b>	350	\$3,500.00 <b>\$7,175.00</b>

07/01/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with team regarding NRA Opposition (.25). Review draft Opposition (.5)	0.75		\$262.50
<b>Phase 3 Totals</b>				<b>0.75</b>		<b>\$262.50</b>

06/27/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review of NRA motion to intervene and for expedited hearing.	0.25		\$112.50
06/30/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft response to NRA motion to intervene.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/06/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review NRA filings re intervention and amicus participation.	0.25		\$112.50
<b>Phase 3 Totals</b>				<b>1.00</b>	450	<b>\$450.00</b>

06/30/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Brady Center's draft of opposition to the NRA's motion to intervene.	2.50		\$875.00
07/05/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Participated in conference call to discuss Florida and NRA filings.	1.25	350	\$437.50
<b>Phase 3 Totals</b>				<b>3.75</b>		<b>\$1,312.50</b>

06/28/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Read Defendant's filing in support of NVRA's motion to intervene.	0.50		\$175.00
<b>Phase 3 Totals</b>				<b>0.50</b>	350	<b>\$175.00</b>

06/27/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence re NRA motion to intervene (.5) and telephone conference with counsel for state regarding timing and schedule of briefing in case (1.0)	1.50		\$675.00
06/30/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise draft memo from Brady regarding opposition to NRA intervention; email correspondence with team, etc.	1.50	450	\$675.00
06/30/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with B. Dewar regarding intervention papers (.5); additional revisions (1.0).	1.50	450	\$675.00
07/08/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Address issues raised by court denial of NRA motion to intervene.	1.00	450	\$450.00
<b>Phase 3 Totals</b>				<b>5.50</b>		<b>\$2,475.00</b>

	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fee</b>
<b>Phase 3</b>	32.00	\$11,850.00

**Phase 4 - Oral Argument**

07/08/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Prepare brief binder and case binder for D. Hallward-Driemeier in preparation for Oral Argument;	4.00		\$600.00
07/11/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Prepare declarations and exhibits for D. Hallward in preparation for Oral Argument.	2.25	150	\$337.50
<b>Phase 4 Totals</b>				<b>6.25</b>	150	<b>\$937.50</b>

07/07/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding preparation for oral argument.	0.50		\$175.00
					350	



07/11/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Prepared for D.Hallward-Driemeier moot argument for PI hearing on 7/13/11 by conferring with D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding outstanding key issues for PI argument (1.0) and by revising and annotating case materials in preparation for oral argument (3.5); conferred with S.Antzoulatos regarding preparing additional materials for argument. (.25)	4.75		
					350	\$1,662.50
07/12/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with D.Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim concerning strategy for oral argument and issues to be addressed (.50) as well as annotated materials for argument (.25); prepared annotated copies of statute, Board of Medicine letter, and Board of Medicine minutes for D.Hallward-Driemeier use at argument. (.25)	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
07/13/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Met with D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and E.Mullins for final preparations for oral argument.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
07/13/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Oral argument on preliminary injunction motion.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
<b>Phase 4 Totals</b>				<b>8.25</b>		<b>\$2,887.50</b>

07/11/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Confer with B. Dewar and A. Ripa about PI hearing and moot court preparation.	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
07/11/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Moot court session with D. Hallward-Driemeier and team to prepare for preliminary injunction hearing.	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
<b>Phase 4 Totals</b>				<b>4.50</b>		<b>\$1,575.00</b>

07/11/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Prepare for and attend moot court. Prepare and revise oral argument outline.	8.50		
					450	\$3,825.00
07/12/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Prepare for oral argument of preliminary injunction motion.	8.50		
					450	\$3,825.00
07/13/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Prepare for, attend and present oral argument on preliminary injunction motion.	4.50		
					450	\$2,025.00
<b>Phase 4 Totals</b>				<b>21.50</b>		<b>\$9,675.00</b>

07/11/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted questions on captive audience doctrine to assist with moot court.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
07/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed transcript from hearing on Motion for Preliminary Injunction.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
<b>Phase 4 Totals</b>				<b>1.50</b>		<b>\$525.00</b>

07/11/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft questions for B. Manheim and D. Hallward-Driemeier for moot court session and participate in same.	4.25		
					350	\$1,487.50
<b>Phase 4 Totals</b>				<b>4.25</b>		<b>\$1,487.50</b>

07/11/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meeting with team regarding preparation for PI hearing; review additional cases.	3.25		
					450	\$1,462.50
07/12/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meeting with E. Mullins regarding preliminary injunction hearing.	2.00		
					450	\$900.00
07/13/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Attend and participate in oral argument and hearing on preliminary injunction request; follow up with clients and local counsel.	5.50		
					450	\$2,475.00
<b>Phase 4 Totals</b>				<b>10.75</b>		<b>\$4,837.50</b>

07/11/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Moot argument for preliminary injunction hearing and follow up;	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
<b>Phase 4 Totals</b>				<b>1.50</b>		<b>\$525.00</b>

	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fee</b>
<b>Phase 4</b>	58.50	\$22,450.00

## Phase 5 - Supplemental Brief and Response to Defendants' Motion to Strike

07/13/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with clients J.Schaechter, L.Cosgrove, T.Schechtman, and B.Wollschlaeger regarding additional factual material for supplemental submission.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/13/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Met with D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and E.Mullins following oral argument to outline supplemental submission to court.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00

07/14/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Drafted outline of supplemental submission and necessary supplemental research necessary (4.0); worked with co-counsel and team regarding same (.75)	4.75	350	\$1,662.50
07/15/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with J.Schaechter and B.Manheim regarding issue with respect to potential materials for submission with supplemental memorandum.	1.00	350	\$350.00
07/16/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Emails to/from B.Manheim and D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding supplemental submission; revised draft supplemental submission per D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim comments.	4.00	350	\$1,400.00
07/17/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed and proposed revisions to draft supplemental declarations for J.Schaechter, B.Wollschlaeger, and T.Schechtman.	0.75	350	\$262.50
07/18/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Numerous substantive e-mails to/from J.Lewis, B.Manheim, and D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding proposed revisions to supplemental submission (.5); conferred with J.Lewis regarding revisions to submission. (.25)	0.75	350	\$262.50
07/18/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Read amicus brief (.25); emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier, E.Mullins, H.Lucas, and B.Manheim regarding same. (.25)	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/18/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Numerous e-mails to/from M.Goetz, B.Manheim, and D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding additional revisions to supplemental declarations (.25); reviewed J.Schaechter final declaration. (.25)	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/19/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with B.Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier, E. Mullins, D. Vice, and J. Lewis regarding additional revisions to supplemental brief and implemented those revisions (2.5); conferred with J.Lewis regarding same (.50); e-mails to/from S.Lemmon regarding additional research on legislative history issue (.50).	3.50	350	\$1,225.00
07/19/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from M.Goetz, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding additional edits to declarations.	0.25	350	\$87.50
07/25/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Numerous emails to/from S.Lemmon regarding drafting and information for supplementary declarations regarding failure of board of medicine to advise physicians of rescind letter (.25); conferred with S.Lemmon regarding declarations (.25); emails to/from E.Mullins and S.Lemmon regarding proposed revisions to language of declaration; revised motion to supplement record. (.25)	0.75	350	\$262.50
07/26/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and E.Mullins regarding content of, and whether to file, additional supplemental declarations in response to clients' not having received copies of updated Tootle letter.	0.25	350	\$87.50
07/27/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Read State's motion to strike (.1); emails to/from E.Mullins and B.Manheim regarding response thereto. (.15)	0.25	350	\$87.50
08/11/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Read and provided comments on draft motion to strike (.25); emails to/from R.Dugas and S.Lemmon regarding further revisions to same (.25); reviewed R.Dugas edits and provided comments on same. (.25)	0.75	350	\$262.50
<b>Phase 5 Totals</b>				<b>19.00</b>		<b>\$6,650.00</b>

07/14/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review transcript from PI hearing and emails with B. Dewar regarding outline for supplemental briefing (5.25). Team meeting regarding supplemental briefing strategy (1.0).	6.75	350	\$2,362.50
07/14/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Phone calls with multiple doctors regarding additional anecdotes (1.0). Draft declarations. (1.0)	2.00	350	\$700.00
07/15/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Draft declarations for Dr. Tommy Schechtman and Dr. Judy Schaechter	4.00	350	\$1,400.00
07/15/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Confer with B. Dewar regarding supplemental briefing issues.	0.75	350	\$262.50
07/17/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Draft and revise declarations for Schaechter, Schechtman, and Wollschlaeger, and emails with team regarding same.	3.75	350	\$1,312.50
07/18/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Draft and revise declarations for Schaechter, Schechtman, and Wollschlaeger (5.0), and emails with team regarding same (.5). Conference calls with doctors to discuss (1.0) and implement revisions (1.0). Revise and finalize declarations and send to team (1.0).	8.50	350	\$2,975.00

07/19/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Review draft supplemental brief.	2.50	350	\$875.00
07/19/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Revise multiple physician declarations (.75) and conference call with Judy Schaechter regarding declaration edits (.5). Emails with team regarding supplemental declarations and briefing issues. (.25).	1.50	350	\$525.00
07/20/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with team regarding supplemental briefing and additional developments in case.	1.50	350	\$525.00
<b>Phase 5 Totals</b>				<b>31.25</b>		<b>\$10,937.50</b>

07/13/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Meet with clients to discuss oral argument and strategy for supplemental filing.	2.00	450	\$900.00
07/16/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft supplemental memorandum.	1.75	450	\$787.50
07/17/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft ACLU amicus brief.	0.75	450	\$337.50
07/17/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise supplemental declarations of Drs. Wollschlaeger, Schaechter, and Schechtman.	1.50	450	\$675.00
07/18/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Prepare comments on draft amicus brief (1.0). Consult with team regarding comments and revisions to plaintiff declarations. (.75)	1.75	450	\$787.50
07/18/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise supplemental brief in response to preliminary injunction hearing.	4.50	450	\$2,025.00
07/19/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Final review of draft supplemental memorandum in support of PI and review and incorporate changes proposed by Brady Center and Ed Mullins.	3.00	450	\$1,350.00
07/19/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review amicus brief of ACLU.	1.50	450	\$675.00
07/19/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise supplemental brief in light of Defendants' change in position.	5.00	450	\$2,250.00
07/20/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Draft, and respond to correspondence to clients regarding developments in supplemental briefing.	1.00	450	\$450.00
07/22/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Correspondence with clients regarding process of suit going forward.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/25/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise declarations and motion for leave to file declarations regarding BOM failure to advise physicians of letter rescinding June 14 guidance.	1.00	450	\$450.00
07/26/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Discussions with Mr. Manheim and Mr. Lemmon regarding possible supplemental filing regarding BOM's failure to notify doctors of July 18 letter.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/27/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and analyze Defendants' motion to strike supplemental brief.	0.75	450	\$337.50
<b>Phase 5 Totals</b>				<b>25.50</b>		<b>\$11,475.00</b>

07/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Compared NRA Brief, Florida's brief, and Florida's oral argument transcript to determine similarities and differences in their interpretation of "harassment" and "relevant."	0.75	350	\$262.50
07/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with B. Manheim, E. Dewar, J. Lewis, R. Dugas, A. Ripa to discuss additional briefing to draft in wake of hearing on Motion for Preliminary Injunction.	1.00	350	\$350.00
07/15/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Compared NRA Brief, Florida's brief, and Florida's oral argument transcript to determine similarities and differences in their interpretation of "harassment" and "relevant."	3.50	350	\$1,225.00
07/18/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with E. Dewar to determine next steps for reply brief.	0.25	350	\$87.50
07/19/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Conducted research in attempt to find Eleventh Circuit case stating that courts should review legislative history to determine whether statute is viewpoint neutral.	2.50	350	\$875.00
07/19/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with E. Dewar on finding Florida disciplinary statutes using term "should."	0.25	350	\$87.50
07/20/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed supplemental filing.	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/25/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Called doctors to discuss declarations regarding Board of Medicine letters.	1.00	350	\$350.00
07/25/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Called plaintiffs to discuss their experience with letter from Board of Medicine that interpreted statute	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/25/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted declarations.	1.50	350	\$525.00

07/25/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Discussed motion for leave to file supplemental declarations with D. Hallward-Driemeier.	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/25/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted declarations regarding Board of Medicine letters interpreting statute.	3.00	350	\$1,050.00
07/25/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted Motion for Leave to File Supplemental Declarations.	1.25	350	\$437.50
07/25/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited declarations to incorporate D. Hallward-Driemeier's comments.	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/26/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted email to plaintiffs explaining decision not to file motion.	0.50	350	\$175.00
07/26/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited declarations for plaintiffs regarding Board of Medicine letters interpreting statute.	0.75	350	\$262.50
07/26/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited declarations, Motion for Leave to File Supplemental Declarations.	3.25	350	\$1,137.50
07/26/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with plaintiffs to ensure that declarations were accurate.	0.50	350	\$175.00
08/10/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Strike Plaintiffs' Supplemental Memorandum.	6.50	350	\$2,275.00
08/11/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Incorporated B. Manheim edits into Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Strike.	1.50	350	\$525.00
08/11/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Incorporated R. Dugar, E. Dewar edits into Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Strike.	2.75	350	\$962.50
08/12/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Opposition to Motion to Strike to include E. Mullins's comments.	0.50	350	\$175.00
<b>Phase 5 Totals</b>				<b>33.25</b>		<b>\$11,637.50</b>

07/14/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Prepared for and participated in meeting with B. Manheim and Florida Gun Law Associates to discuss preparation of supplemental briefing on preliminary injunction motion.	5.75	350	\$2,012.50
07/14/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research cases for B. Dewar indicating that courts should look to a statute's legislative history and legislative purpose in determining whether the statute is viewpoint-discriminatory and drafted email to B. Manheim and D. Hallward-Driemeier analyzing same.	3.00	350	\$1,050.00
07/15/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research cases for B. Dewar where a statute with a relevance standard was held to be unconstitutionally vague and others stating that a state entity's interpretation in its legal pleadings of a law that it is responsible for enforcing must guide the court's construction of that statute.	7.00	350	\$2,450.00
07/16/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Research cases for B. Dewar holding that the fact that a party presents different interpretations of an ambiguous statute in its legal pleadings is evidence in and of itself of the statute's vagueness.	3.00	350	\$1,050.00
07/18/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Read ACLU amicus brief and declarations for Wollschlaeger, Schectman, and Schaecter.	1.50	350	\$525.00
07/18/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Correspond with B. Dewar, D. Hallward-Driemeier, and B. Manheim to draft and revise supplemental brief in support for motion for preliminary injunction, including finding missing citations, rewriting paragraphs, entering team edits, and proofreading.	7.75	350	\$2,712.50
07/19/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Correspond with B. Dewar, D. Hallward-Driemeier, and B. Manheim to draft and revise supplemental brief in support for motion for preliminary injunction, including finding missing citations, rewriting paragraphs, entering team edits, proofreading, and reworking in light of Defendants' supplemental filing.	8.75	350	\$3,062.50
<b>Phase 5 Totals</b>				<b>36.75</b>		<b>\$12,862.50</b>

07/14/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Additional email correspondence with team regarding analysis.	1.00	450	\$450.00
07/14/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Attend meeting with litigation team regarding next steps in preparation of supplemental brief, in light of oral argument.	1.50	450	\$675.00
07/14/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Prepare stat analysis outline for brief; forward to team.	1.50	450	\$675.00

07/14/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up on next steps for drafting of supplemental brief; additional declarations.	1.00	450	\$450.00
07/15/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Numerous revisions to draft supplemental brief.	3.00	450	\$1,350.00
07/18/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Continued drafting and revision of supplemental brief . (2.0) Review supplemental draft declarations (1.0); follow up with team on revisions to brief (.5); meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding same. (.5)	4.00	450	\$1,800.00
07/19/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise brief with D. Hallward-Driemeier to incorporate Brady and Mullins firm comments. (4.0) Review draft brief from DJD (1.0); email correspondence with co-counsel from Brady and Mullins firms (.5). Redraft and revise supplemental brief to address State supplemental filing and revised BOM letter. (5.0)	10.50	450	\$4,725.00
07/20/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Correspond with team on government brief and supplemental brief, and Toole letter. (1.5) Additional email correspondence regarding next steps and reports to clients. (.5)	2.00	450	\$900.00
07/21/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence regarding PI issuance and other related issues (.5); Review FL Constitution and FL Supreme Court certification issues. (.5) Correspond regarding next steps with co-counsel and D. Hallward-Driemeier. (.5)	1.50	450	\$675.00
07/25/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence in connection with impending Preliminary Injunction Decision. (.25) Review draft supplemental papers and declarations prepared by S. Lemmon. (1.0)	1.25	450	\$562.50
07/26/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review state's Motion to Strike Supplemental Memo (.25); follow up email correspondence regarding response. (.25) Additional email correspondence regarding state's Motion to Strike. (.5)	1.50	450	\$675.00
07/28/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence regarding case and related matters.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/29/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence regarding case and Preliminary Injunction. Review state's Motion to Strike and next steps regarding Scheduling Order.	1.25	450	\$562.50
08/09/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up on opposition to Motion to Strike; revisions to Joint Motion to Extend.	1.50	450	\$675.00
08/11/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review revised Opposition to Motion to Strike; telephone conference with S. Lemon regarding same.	0.75	450	\$337.50
08/12/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Draft and incorporate revisions to Opposition to Motion to Strike; email correspondence regarding same.	1.50	450	\$675.00
08/15/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Final review and revisions to opposition to motion to strike; file with Court. Email correspondence regarding FMA issues.	2.50	450	\$1,125.00
<b>Phase 5 Totals</b>				<b>36.75</b>		<b>\$16,537.50</b>

07/14/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Team meeting re: next steps for response to Court's request for supplemental pleading	1.00	350	\$350.00
<b>Phase 5 Totals</b>				<b>1.00</b>		<b>\$350.00</b>

	Total Hours	Total Fee
Phase 5	183.50	\$70,450.00

## Phase 6 - Motion for Summary Judgment Proceedings

11/10/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Prepare pleading binder for A. Ripa.	1.00	150	\$150.00
11/15/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Run searches for A. Ripa for examples of Opposition to Summary Judgment Motions from SD Florida (1.0); discuss workspace issues with A. Ripa (.5)	1.50	150	\$225.00
12/01/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Discuss upcoming deadlines with A. Ripa (.25); prepare exhibits. (.75)	1.00	150	\$150.00
12/04/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Cite check, edit, revise and blue book Replies.	2.50	150	\$375.00
12/05/11	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Edit, revise and work with associates to prepare replies for filing in florida.	2.50	150	\$375.00
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>8.50</b>		<b>\$1,275.00</b>

10/12/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and E.Mullins regarding State's decision to pursue summary judgment and related strategy.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/14/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, K.O'Connell, and S.Lemmon regarding strategy for summary judgment motion.	0.75	350	\$262.50
10/24/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed draft motion for summary judgment and emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier and S.Lemmon regarding comments and proposed revisions to same.	1.00	350	\$350.00
10/26/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Numerous e-mails to/from E.Mullins, D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, K.O'Connell, and S.Lemmon regarding drafts of summary judgment brief and stipulated statement of facts and revisions thereto, potential participation of additional amici, and recently issued decision for possible inclusion in summary judgment briefing.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/28/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon and E.Mullins regarding revisions to draft statement of stipulated facts; reviewed E.Mullins' revisions to same.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/01/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed revised proposed statement of undisputed facts; emails to/from S.Lemmon regarding same.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/03/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed state revisions to proposed statement of stipulated facts and emails to/from E.Mullins, B.Manheim, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and S.Lemmon regarding same.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/04/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Email to Ropes team conveying proposed revisions to proposed statement of stipulated facts.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/09/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed opposing counsel's second round of objections to statement of undisputed facts and emails to/from B.Manheim, E.Mullins, S.Lemmon, and K.O'Connell regarding same.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/11/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	Conferred with S.Lemmon regarding filing of motion for summary judgment and emails to/from S.Lemmon and E.Mullins regarding same.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/14/11	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	ASSOCIATE	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding defendants' motion for summary judgment and responses thereto; read defendants' submissions.	0.50	350	\$175.00
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>4.25</b>		<b>\$1,487.50</b>

10/14/11	Goetz, Mariel	ASSOCIATE	Emails with S. Lemmon and K. O'Connell regarding case filings.	0.25	350	\$87.50
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>0.25</b>		<b>\$87.50</b>

10/12/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review recent minutes of Board of Medicine for further statements re Firearms Privacy Act.	0.25	450	\$112.50
10/12/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Confer with team regarding summary judgment motion in light of defendants' determination not to consent to convert PI into permanent injunction.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/14/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Call to Jay Vail to discuss cross-summary judgment motions.	0.25	450	\$112.50
10/14/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Meet with Mr. Manheim, Mr. Mullins, Ms. Dewar, Mr. Lemmon, and Ms. O'Connell to discuss summary judgment motion.	0.75	450	\$337.50
10/20/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Draft correspondence to counsel for defendants regarding joint statement of undisputed facts.	0.25	450	\$112.50
10/21/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Confer with Mr. Manheim regarding schedule for summary judgment briefing in light of state's failure to respond to request for stipulated statement of facts. Send email to counsel for defendants regarding schedule.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/24/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and provide comments on draft motion for summary judgment.	1.25	450	\$562.50
10/31/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and provide comments on draft statement of undisputed facts.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/08/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and revise draft statement of undisputed facts.	0.75	450	\$337.50

11/09/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review Defendants' response to proposed statement of facts.	0.75	450	\$337.50
11/10/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and revise memorandum in support of summary judgment.	2.50	450	\$1,125.00
11/11/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Further revise memorandum in support of summary judgment.	2.00	450	\$900.00
11/16/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review defendants' motion for summary judgment and statement in support. (1.0) Conversation with Mr. Ripa re same. (.5)	1.50	450	\$675.00
11/23/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review of Defendants' opposition to motion for summary judgment.	1.25	450	\$562.50
11/28/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise opposition to defendants' motion for summary judgment.	1.50	450	\$675.00
11/29/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Meet with team to outline revisions to opposition to defendants' summary judgment motion.	1.50	450	\$675.00
11/30/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise draft opposition to defendants' summary judgment motion.	5.00	450	\$2,250.00
12/05/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Revise reply in support of motion for summary judgment and response to defendants' statement of material facts.	3.50	450	\$1,575.00
12/14/11	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Analyze possible significance of Florida statute criminalizing making of records concerning ownership of firearms. Communicate with co-counsel and Dr. St. Petery re same.	0.75	450	\$337.50
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>25.25</b>		<b>\$11,362.50</b>

10/13/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Multiple emails with E. Mullins regarding application of local rules to summary judgment motions.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Attended meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier, B. Manheim, E. Mullins, E. Dewar, K. O'Connell regarding motion for summary judgment.	1.00	350	\$350.00
10/18/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed filings for preparation of motion for summary judgment.	0.75	350	\$262.50
10/18/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted motion for summary judgment.	2.50	350	\$875.00
10/19/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted Motion for Summary Judgment and memorandum.	6.75	350	\$2,362.50
10/22/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted motion for summary judgment.	3.75	350	\$1,312.50
10/23/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted motion for summary judgment.	1.25	350	\$437.50
10/24/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited K. O'Connell's draft Statement of Undisputed Facts to be filed with the Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.50	350	\$525.00
10/24/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted Motion for Summary Judgment, Proposed Order.	8.75	350	\$3,062.50
10/25/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited unopposed motion, proposed order to extend deadline for filing cross motions for summary judgment.	0.50	350	\$175.00
10/31/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Undisputed Statement of Facts to incorporate comments by D. Hallward-Driemeier, B. Manheim.	4.50	350	\$1,575.00
11/03/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed Florida's proposed statement of undisputed facts.	1.00	350	\$350.00
11/04/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited proposed statement of facts.	3.75	350	\$1,312.50
11/07/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Proposed Joint Statement of Facts for negotiation with Defendants.	1.25	350	\$437.50
11/08/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Joint Statement of Facts to conform to agreement with Defendants.	1.25	350	\$437.50
11/09/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Discussed next steps for Motion for Summary Judgment with A. Ripa.	0.50	350	\$175.00
11/09/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Joint Statement of Facts to conform to agreement with Defendants.	0.75	350	\$262.50
11/10/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Finalized, sent revised Statement of Facts to opposing counsel.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/10/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with A. Ripa regarding status of Motion for Summary Judgment, next steps.	0.75	350	\$262.50
11/10/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with B. Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier, A. Ripa, K. O'Connell to edit Motion for Summary Judgment in preparation for filing on November 11, 2011.	11.50	350	\$4,025.00
11/11/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with B. Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier, A. Ripa, K. O'Connell to edit Motion for Summary Judgment in preparation for filing.	10.25	350	\$3,587.50

11/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.00	350	\$350.00
11/15/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Correspondance with K. O'Connell, A. Ripa regarding status of response to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment and next steps.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
11/18/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Correspondence with K. O'Connell, A. Ripa regarding status of brief and next steps.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
11/20/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited opposition to Defendant's Motion for Summary Judgment.	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00
11/21/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	4.75		
					350	\$1,662.50
11/22/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Opposition to Defendant's Motion for Summary Judgment.	9.50		
					350	\$3,325.00
11/23/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	7.25		
					350	\$2,537.50
11/28/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted email update on case for B. Manheim to send Plaintiffs.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
11/29/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted explanation of disagreements with Defendants' Statement of Facts.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
11/29/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with D. Hallward-Driemeier, A. Ripa, K. O'Connell regarding status of briefing, next steps.	1.75		
					350	\$612.50
11/29/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Worked with A. Ripa, K. O'Connell to edit Opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	7.25		
					350	\$2,537.50
11/30/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited J. Lewis's draft of T. Schechtman declaration.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
11/30/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Correspondence with K. O'Connell, A. Ripa regarding status of Opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
11/30/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Opposition to Defendant's Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
11/30/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed A. Ripa's edits to Opposition to Defendants' Motion to Dismiss.	1.75		
					350	\$612.50
12/01/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
12/02/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Reply to Defendants' Response to Plaintiffs' Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
12/02/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted reply to Defendants' response to Plaintiffs' Supplemental Statement of Facts.	2.50		
					350	\$875.00
12/02/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted vagueness, overbreadth sections of Reply to Defendants' Response to Plaintiffs' Motion for Summary Judgment.	3.75		
					350	\$1,312.50
12/05/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Reply to Defendants' Response to Plaintiffs' Supplemental Statement of Undisputed Facts.	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00
12/05/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Edited Reply to Defendants' Opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion for Summary Judgment.	3.75		
					350	\$1,312.50
12/12/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Drafted email updating Plaintiffs on status of litigation.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
12/14/11	Lemmon, Scott	ASSOCIATE	Searched Westlaw for cases citing Florida Statute 790.335.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>121.50</b>		<b>\$42,525.00</b>

10/17/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Call with K. O'Connell re: summary judgment motion. Review board meeting minutes and emails from D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim re: summary judgment.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
11/29/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Interview Dr. Tommy Schectman and draft Schectman declaration re: accidental shooting.	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
11/30/11	Lewis, Julia	ASSOCIATE	Draft and revise Schectman declaration. Coordinate signing of declaration. Call with Dr. Schectman regarding finalized declaration.	1.25		
					350	\$437.50
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>3.00</b>		<b>\$1,050.00</b>

10/12/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up with S. Lemon regarding Summary Judgment motions.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
10/13/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on Summary Judgment Motion in case.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
10/14/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on Summary Judgment Motion issues.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00



10/14/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meeting with team and E. Mullins to discuss Summary Judgment Motion and next steps.	0.75	450	\$337.50
10/17/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up on timing of Summary Judgment Motions, other matters for clients.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/18/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up on case and development of SJ motions.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/19/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up with S. Lemmon regarding Summary Judgment motions.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/20/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on Summary Judgment Motion and related issues.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/21/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on Summary Judgment motions and state response; meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier to discuss same.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/24/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review Summary Judgment papers prepared by S. Lemon and K. O'Connell.	0.75	450	\$337.50
10/25/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Additional email correspondence relating to Summary Judgment Motion and filing Unopposed Extension Motion with Court.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/25/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with J. Vail regarding extension of Summary Judgment motions and filing of Joint Statement of Undisputed Facts	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/25/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review draft from S. Lemon and K. O'Connell.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/25/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on drafting sections of Citizen Petition outlining background information, etc.	2.50	450	\$1,125.00
10/26/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence and follow up with team.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/26/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on Summary Judgment motion and papers.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/27/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review statement of facts prepared internally and revise.	0.75	450	\$337.50
10/28/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review E. Mullins' edits to statement of facts; follow up with team.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/31/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conversation with S. Lemmon regarding Summary Judgment papers and exchange of proposed joint statement with State.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/01/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with K. Crumbly regarding webinar for American Academy of Pediatrics.	0.75	450	\$337.50
11/03/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review state's revision of Statement of Facts.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/07/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with K. Crumley regarding webinar.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/08/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review final statement of facts and DHD comments on the pleading.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/09/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence and exchange with state regarding agreement on undisputed statement of facts; review S. Lemon draft and provide comments.	0.75	450	\$337.50
11/10/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review draft Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.00	450	\$450.00
11/11/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Additional review of Summary Judgment filings.	0.75	450	\$337.50
11/14/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence regarding state violation of page limit and line spacing rules; telephone conference with J. Vail regarding same; review of Motion for Summary Judgment for arguments.	1.50	450	\$675.00
11/15/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Work on Motion Summary Judgment issues; coordinate response.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/15/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up with J. Vail regarding state's Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/17/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up on Summary Judgment Motions and reply to state brief.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/18/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up on filing of response to state Summary Judgment Motion.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/21/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on opposition to state's Motion for Summary Judgment and related papers.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/23/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review state opposition to plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment.	0.75	450	\$337.50
11/28/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review opposition briefs to state MSJ.	1.00	450	\$450.00
11/29/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone conference with T. Schaecam and J. Lewis regarding declaration.	0.50	450	\$225.00
11/29/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone call with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding case; edit S. Lemmon's email regarding status of case and send same to client.	1.00	450	\$450.00

11/30/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise draft opposition to state motion for summary judgment.	1.00	450	\$450.00
12/01/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise opposition to state Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.00	450	\$450.00
12/02/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Initial review of reply to state opposition to Motion Summary Judgment.	0.50	450	\$225.00
12/05/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Additional review of Summary Judgment reply briefs and papers.	0.50	450	\$225.00
12/05/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up with S. Lemmon and K. O'Connell regarding filings.	0.75	450	\$337.50
12/05/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise draft brief opposing state opposition to Plaintiffs' Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.00	450	\$450.00
12/06/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review pleadings in case and summary judgment papers.	1.00	450	\$450.00
12/08/11	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review papers filed by state in opposition to motion for summary judgment.	1.00	450	\$450.00
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>31.00</b>		<b>\$13,950.00</b>

10/14/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with S. Lemmon to compile relevant previous filings for drafting summary judgment motion.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/14/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with team and local counsel to discuss motion for summary judgment strategy.	1.00	350	\$350.00
10/17/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed preliminary injunction order and briefings to determine relevant undisputed statement of facts.	1.25	350	\$437.50
10/18/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafting separate statement of undisputed facts.	2.00	350	\$700.00
10/18/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Began drafting separate statement of undisputed facts.	2.25	350	\$787.50
10/21/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with S. Lemmon regarding draft of motion for summary judgment.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/24/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Discussion with S. Lemmon regarding revisions to summary judgment motion and separate statement of facts.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/25/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised motion for extension of time per team's comments; corresponded with local counsel regarding same.	0.50	350	\$175.00
10/25/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted motion for extension of time	1.00	350	\$350.00
10/25/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Began revising motion for summary judgment per D. Hallward-Driemeier's comments.	1.00	350	\$350.00
10/25/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued revising motion for summary judgment per D. Hallward-Driemeier's comments.	2.75	350	\$962.50
10/26/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised separate statement of facts, corresponded with team regarding same, and circulated to local counsel.	0.50	350	\$175.00
10/26/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted final revisions to motion for summary judgment and corresponded with team regarding review.	0.75	350	\$262.50
10/26/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafted revised motion for summary judgment per D. Hallward-Driemeier's comments.	1.75	350	\$612.50
10/31/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with S. Lemmon regarding revisions to separate statement of facts.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/31/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed final revised SSOF and corresponded with S. Lemmon regarding same.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/01/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted final draft of separate statement of facts to send to the State.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/03/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with team regarding government's proposed revisions to separate statement of facts.	0.75	350	\$262.50
11/04/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with team about the pros and cons of two separate statements of fact.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/04/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Made further revisions to new proposed statement of facts.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/04/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with S. Lemmon to discuss revisions to defendant's separate statement of facts and drafted same.	1.75	350	\$612.50
11/08/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with S. Lemmon regarding revised SSOF; aided and analyzed same.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/09/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with team to revise SSOF per State's comments; corresponded with the State regarding same.	0.50	350	\$175.00

11/10/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with team regarding enlargement of page limit and drafted motion regarding same.	0.75	350	\$262.50
11/10/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised supplemental statement of facts and corresponded with S. Lemmon regarding same; confirmed challenged provisions.	1.75	350	\$612.50
11/10/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa to revise MSJ, proposed order, and SSOF; drafted revisions to same.	2.50	350	\$875.00
11/11/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted revisions and finalized motion for summary judgment and related documents; worked with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa regarding same.	5.25	350	\$1,837.50
11/15/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed Defendant's motion for summary judgment (1.0); corresponded with team regarding approach to opposition (.25); meeting with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa regarding same; (.5) began analyzing Defendant's past pleadings for inconsistencies with current motion. (.5)	2.25	350	\$787.50
11/16/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed Defendant's past pleading for inconsistencies with motion for summary judgment.	1.00	350	\$350.00
11/16/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted email to S. Lemmon and A. Ripa summarizing inconsistencies between Defendant's pleadings (1.0); corresponded with them regarding same (.5)	1.50	350	\$525.00
11/16/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Began analyzing case law and outlining argument opposing defendant's motion for summary judgment.	1.50	350	\$525.00
11/17/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed relevant case law and continued outlining Title VII argument for opposition to motion for summary judgment.	3.75	350	\$1,312.50
11/18/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with A. Ripa and S. Lemmon regarding tenor of opposition, next steps, and additional research (.5); analyzed current opposition (.5)	1.00	350	\$350.00
11/18/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted argument regarding sections 5 and 6 for opposition to defendant's motion for summary judgment.	1.75	350	\$612.50
11/18/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted and revised opposition to Defendant's motion for summary judgment.	2.00	350	\$700.00
11/21/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafting opposition to Defendant's motion for summary judgment; worked with S. Lemmon regarding same	3.50	350	\$1,225.00
11/21/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Researched additional ADA and Title VII and First Amendment case law	2.00	350	\$700.00
11/22/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with S. Lemmon on opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/22/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted and revised opposition to defendant's motion for summary judgment.	5.50	350	\$1,925.00
11/23/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with S. Lemmon on drafting and revising opposition to defendant's motion for summary judgment.	3.75	350	\$1,312.50
11/28/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued analyzing case law regarding Defendant's opposition (1.5); corespondence with S. Lemmon regarding same. (.5)	2.00	350	\$700.00
11/28/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Began analyzing Defendant's opposition and all cited case law.	2.25	350	\$787.50
11/29/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Multiple emails and calls with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa on revising latest draft of opposition to Defendant's motion for summary judgment (.5); discussed action plan for reply. (.5)	1.00	350	\$350.00
11/29/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with D. Hallward-Driemeier, S. Lemmon, and A. Ripa on revisions to opposition to motion for summary judgment, reply and Defendant's statement of facts.	7.25	350	\$2,537.50
11/30/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed and commented on A. Ripa revisions; discussion with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa regarding same.	1.25	350	\$437.50
11/30/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised opposition to Defendant's motion for summary judgment per team's comments.	1.75	350	\$612.50
11/30/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafting Reply brief (2.0); drafted response to Defendant's objections to Plaintiff's supplemental statement of facts (1.0); multiple emails and calls with A. Ripa and S. Lemmon regarding same. (.75)	3.75	350	\$1,312.50

11/30/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Began drafting outline for Reply; worked with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa regarding same; began drafting section of same.	4.00		
					350	\$1,400.00
12/01/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted revised version of reply to Defendants' opposition.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
12/01/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed D. Hallward-Driemeier's revisions to opposition and further revised opposition to Defendant's motion for summary judgment (4.0); analyzed and commented on draft of Reply brief using L. Suarez's suggestions (1.0); finalized all documents for filing. (1.0)	6.00		
					350	\$2,100.00
12/02/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted revised version of reply to Defendants' opposition.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
12/02/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised reply brief to Defendants' opposition; drafted response to opposition to statement of facts; worked with A. Ripa and S. Lemmon regarding same.	3.25		
					350	\$1,137.50
12/05/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised reply per S. Antzoulatos comments (1.0); corresponded with her regarding same. (.25)	1.25		
					350	\$437.50
12/05/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Located citation for reply revision (.25); correspondence with S. Lemmon regarding revisions per D. Hallward-Driemeier (.5); analyzed same (.25); worked with team to revise reply to fact objections (.25); analyzed B. Manheim revisions (.25); analyzed final revisions and drafts prior to filing. (.25)	1.75		
					350	\$612.50
12/08/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed correspondence from team and Plaintiffs regarding new gun law case; analyzed local rules to determine when Defendants' reply is due.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
12/09/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed Defendants' reply in support of their motion for summary judgment; corresponded with team regarding same.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
12/14/11	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed correspondence from clients and team regarding gun law.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>97.75</b>		<b>\$34,212.50</b>

11/10/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise joint statement of facts and summary judgment memo and motion (5.0); coordinate with team re: the same (.5); research new first amendment cases and incorporate the same (3.25)	8.75		
					350	\$3,062.50
11/11/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise joint statement of facts and summary judgment memo and motion; coordinate with team re: the same; coordinate filing of the same	6.50		
					350	\$2,275.00
11/14/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Review Plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment (1.0); analyze applicable authorities regarding the same (1.75); begin drafting opposition to the same (3.5)	6.25		
					350	\$2,187.50
11/15/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft opposition to Plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment; analyze applicable authorities regarding the same	7.50		
					350	\$2,625.00
11/16/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft opposition to Plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment; analyze applicable authorities regarding the same	7.75		
					350	\$2,712.50
11/17/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft opposition to Plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment; analyze applicable authorities regarding the same	6.75		
					350	\$2,362.50
11/18/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft opposition to Plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment; analyze applicable authorities regarding the same	5.00		
					350	\$1,750.00
11/28/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Review D's reply to Plaintiffs opposition for SJ (.5); review draft opposition to D's motion for summary judgment (1.5)	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
11/29/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise opposition to Plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment; analyze applicable authorities regarding the same; begin drafting reply to D's opposition to P's motion for SJ	11.00		
					350	\$3,850.00
11/30/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise opposition to Plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment (5.0); implement DHD's comments re: the same (2.0); draft reply to D's opposition to P's motion for SJ (2.25)	9.25		
					350	\$3,237.50

12/01/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise opposition to Plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment; coordinate filing re: the same; draft and revise reply to D's opposition to P's motion for SJ	8.75		
					350	\$3,062.50
12/02/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Draft and revise summary judgment reply;	7.50	350	\$2,625.00
12/05/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Revise summary judgment reply; coordinate filing re: the same	7.50		
					350	\$2,625.00
12/09/11	Ripa, Augustine	ASSOCIATE	Review state summary judgment filing	0.75	350	\$262.50
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>95.25</b>		<b>\$33,337.50</b>

11/30/11	Suarez, Lauren	PARALEGAL	Westlaw Keycite report and caselaw retrieval; Cite check, fact check, quote check Opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment, per Attorney S. Lemmon.	6.25		
					150	\$937.50
12/01/11	Suarez, Lauren	PARALEGAL	Westlaw Keycite report and case law retrieval; Cite check, fact check, quote check Opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment, per Attorney S. Lemmon.	5.25		
					150	\$787.50
<b>Phase 6 Totals</b>				<b>11.50</b>		<b>\$1,725.00</b>

	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fee</b>
<b>Phase 6</b>	398.25	\$141,012.50

**Phase 7: Motion for Attorneys' Fees and Costs**

NOTE: E. Siegle was a law clerk at Ropes &amp; Gray. Ropes &amp; Gray is voluntarily omitting his time from this motion for attorneys' fees.

07/02/12	Antzoulatos, Sophia	PARALEGAL	Discuss incoming docket entries and upcoming fees filing with team.	0.25		
					150	\$37.50
<b>Phase 7 Totals</b>				<b>0.25</b>		<b>\$37.50</b>

07/09/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Provide guidance to associate team regarding organization of fee petition and recoverable fees and costs.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
07/16/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Provide guidance to associate team regarding organization of fee petition and recoverable fees and costs.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
07/17/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review of draft application for attorneys' fees. (.25) Meeting with Mr. Manheim and Ms. O'Connell to discuss recoverable fees and costs. (.5)	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
07/25/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review draft memorandum in support of attorneys fees.	0.50	450	\$225.00
09/20/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Prepare for and participate in meeting to confer with counsel for defendants regarding fee application.	0.75	450	\$337.50
10/01/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Discuss with Ms. O'Connell revisions to fee request in light of state's objections.	0.25	450	\$112.50
10/02/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review and revise documents in support of fee request.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/05/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Participate in call with Mr. Vail, counsel for defendants, to confer regarding fee request.	0.50	450	\$225.00
10/11/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Confer with Mr. Mullins regarding fee application.	0.25	450	\$112.50
10/31/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Confer with Ms. O'Connell regarding revisions to motion for attorneys fees.	0.25	450	\$112.50
11/24/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Review of memorandum in support of motion for attorneys fees.	0.75	450	\$337.50
11/28/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Confer with Ms. O'Connell regarding revisions to motion for attorneys fees.	0.25	450	\$112.50
11/30/12	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	PARTNER	Finalize Manheim declaration and memorandum in support of attorneys fees	0.50	450	\$225.00
<b>Phase 7 Totals</b>				<b>6.75</b>		<b>\$3,037.50</b>

07/05/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up with associate on case regarding fees petition.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/05/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Reviewed attorney fee submission.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/09/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meet with Doug HD, K. O'Connell regarding attorney fee petition.	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
07/10/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review Brady fee request.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/10/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meeting with team regarding fee petition.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/11/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review figures for fee petition.	0.50	450	\$225.00
07/11/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review Brady fee petition.	0.50	450	\$225.00

07/12/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with Brady concerning attorney fee petition and revisions (.25); follow up with K. O'Connell (.5).	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
07/12/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review K. O'Connell email correspondence regarding attorney fee and calculation of award.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
07/18/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with clients regarding fee petition.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
07/20/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review fee petition documents drafted by K. O'Connell.	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
07/23/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise certain filings in connection with fee petition for Florida case.	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
07/24/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review documents in connection with attorney fee filing.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
07/25/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise declaration and brief in support of attorney fee motion.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
07/25/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review and revise additional documents related to attorney fee petition.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
07/26/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review drafts of fee petitions and accompanying exhibits.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
07/27/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with clients; review draft statement regarding fees for public interest work.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
07/30/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence with team regarding fee petition.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
07/31/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up on Fee Petition and email correspondence with J. Vail.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
08/01/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Email correspondence and meeting with K O'Connell regarding state request for electronic records.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
08/08/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Telephone call with J. Vail regarding schedule and attorney fee petition; follow up with K. O'Connell.	1.00		
					450	\$450.00
08/16/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow-up correspondence with K. O'Connell re fee dispute issues	0.75		
					450	\$337.50
09/18/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meet with D. Hallward Driemeir and K. O'Connell to discuss fee petition.	0.25		
					450	\$112.50
09/18/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Fee petition conference with K. O'Connell.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
09/20/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meet and confer regarding fee petition with K. O'Connell.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
10/01/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on fee petition issues.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
10/04/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Focus on attorney fee petition issues; email correspondence with clients.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
10/05/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Meet and confer on attorney fees with Jay Vail.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
10/10/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Follow up with team on attorney fee petition issues.	0.50		
					450	\$225.00
11/19/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review attorney fee petition and briefs (.25); drafted email to team regarding same. (.25)	0.5		
					403	
11/20/12	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	PARTNER	Review draft fee petition	0.5		
					403	
	<b>Phase 7 Totals</b>			<b>17.50</b>		<b>\$7,425.00</b>

07/02/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed opinion granting motion for summary judgment (.5); worked with team regarding motion for attorney's fees (.5); corresponded with B. Chu to receive updated expense reports (.25); reviewed previous materials to re-familiarize myself and materials to D. Cunningham. (.5)	1.75		
					350	\$612.50
07/03/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Prepared for and met with E. Siegle regarding motion for attorneys' fees research (1.0); analyzed R&G expenses and categorized same (1.5); began drafting outline for motion for attorneys' fees (2.25); worked with co-counsel and team regarding external and internal deadlines for same (.25); analyzed local rules and drafted chart of schedule and requirements. (.25)	5.25		
					350	\$1,837.50
07/05/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafting motion for attorneys fees (2.0); meeting with E. Siegle regarding same (.25); meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding same (.25); continued analyzing expense reports for fee petition. (.5)	3.00		
					350	\$1,050.00

07/09/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with E. Siegle regarding update on case law research and next steps (.5); continued drafting motion for attorneys' fees (2.0); meeting with E. Siegle, B. Manheim, and D. Hallward-Driemeier to discuss fee petition strategy (1.0); continued to work with E. Siegle regarding same (.25); analyzed expenses and drafted email summarizing preliminary numbers for team (1.75); email correspondence with B. Manheim regarding same. (.25)	5.75		
					350	\$2,012.50
07/10/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed research by E. Siegle regarding fee request standards; multiple emails regarding same.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/10/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Prepared for and led meeting with E. Siegle regarding next steps and revisions to expense reports.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/10/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed Brady project billing reports and email correspondence with B. Manheim regarding same.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/11/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Discussion with B. Manheim and follow-up with E. Siegle regarding co-counsel expense reports.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/11/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed E. Siegle's research into expense report issues.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/11/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafting motion for attorneys' fees.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
07/11/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted draft email to Brady Project for B. Manheim regarding fee petition	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/12/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Email correspondence with E. Davila regarding Florida fee schedules and rates and bill of costs.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/12/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with E. Siegle on analysis of hourly reports.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/12/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed fee schedules and created chart comparing various fee rates.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/13/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafting motion for attorneys fees, researching case law and working with E. Siegle as necessary.	2.25		
					350	\$787.50
07/16/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafting motion for attorneys' fees and analyzing expense reports in order to do so.	2.00		
					350	\$700.00
07/16/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Began drafting timekeeper total spreadsheet as exhibit to motion.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/16/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued drafting motion for attorneys fees and analyzed case law regarding same.	2.75		
					350	\$962.50
07/16/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with Brady counsel regarding revisions to expense reports.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/16/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed time sheets from co-counsel for areas to delete.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/17/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with B. Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier, and E. Siegle regarding issues related to motion for attorneys' fees.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
07/17/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised and finalized draft motion for attorneys fees and supporting documents to send to D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim to review.	2.50		
					350	\$875.00
07/17/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued to analyze all expense reports and draft motion for fees and supporting documentation.	2.25		
					350	\$787.50
07/20/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted exhibit of all ropes expense data and related analysis sheet.	2.50		
					350	\$875.00
07/23/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted Brady exhibit of all time by phase and totaled same.	1.25		
					350	\$437.50
07/24/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted Mullins exhibit fee spreadsheet and revised totals timesheet accordingly.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
07/24/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with E. Siegle regarding 1920 cost project.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/24/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted email to team regarding motion for attorneys fees and all drafted exhibits for review.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/24/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with E. Siegle and E. Mullins regarding bill of costs requirements and procedures.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/25/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Correspond with B. Chu, E. Siegle, and E. Davila on receiving updated costs and drafted related forms and pleadings.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
07/25/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed comments and revisions to motion and supporting documents by B. Manheim and addressed same.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
07/25/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Researched ability to recover fees for litigating fee award.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00

07/25/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised motion for attorneys' fees and declaration per D. Hallward-Driemeier's comments and sent revised version to co-counsel.	0.75		
					350	\$262.50
07/26/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed research regarding fees for fees and revised motion to reflect same.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/30/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Emailed co-counsel and team draft Bill of Costs and next steps.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/30/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Emails with team and co-counsel with revised motion, bill of costs, and declarations for review.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/30/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised supporting exhibits to include updated fees.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
07/30/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Researched case law regarding expectation of attorneys fees when continue to litigate.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
07/30/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised motion for attorneys' fees per E. Mullins' comments.	1.25		
					350	\$437.50
07/30/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised and finalized motion for attorneys fees and all eight supporting exhibits and served on opposing counsel (.3.0); drafted memorandum in support of bill of costs (.25); worked with local counsel to file same (.25); emails with J. Vail regarding bill of costs (.25); multiple emails and calls with team and co-counsel regarding issues about same (1.75); emailed draft motion and supporting documents to J. Vail. (.25)	4.75		
					350	\$1,662.50
07/31/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Multiple emails between B. Manheim, E. Mullins, and D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding request for extension and electronic documents.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
07/31/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with co-counsel and accounts payable to receive supporting documents and revised Bill of Costs regarding same.	1.75		
					350	\$612.50
08/01/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted and reviewed multiple emails with B. Manheim and J. Vail regarding extension and electronic documents	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
08/01/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Researched case law regarding electronic document and work product.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
08/01/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised Bill of Costs and memorandum in support per conference with opposing counsel and worked with local counsel to file revised version of same.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
08/02/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Worked with Lit Tech and Document Processing regarding exhibits to motion for fees.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
08/02/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised government's motion for extension of time to file fee motion and stay and worked with B. Manheim regarding same.	1.25		
					350	\$437.50
08/06/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised motion for extension, working with B. Manheim and E. Mullins regarding same.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
08/07/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Discussion with B. Manheim regarding correspondence and call with J. Vail.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
08/07/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Prepared for call with J. Vail with B. Manheim and participated in same.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
08/07/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised draft motion for enlargement and stay per conversation with J. Vail and emailed draft to same.	0.50		
					350	\$175.00
08/09/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Emails with local counsel and team regarding call and article about judge.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
08/09/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Prepared appearance of counsel forms and worked with support to file same.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
08/21/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed order granting costs and extension.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
08/22/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding judge's order; email to team regarding same.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
09/06/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed costs from co-counsel and R&G (.5); drafted revised memo and exhibit setting forth claimed costs (.75); drafted email to J. Vail regarding same. (.25)	1.50		
					350	\$525.00
09/14/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed draft response to motion for attorneys' fees and corresponded with team regarding same.	1.00		
					350	\$350.00
09/17/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding response to fee petition; reviewed email correspondence from co-counsel and attached website.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50
09/18/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed docket regarding extension and researched filing deadlines; emailed D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding same.	0.25		
					350	\$87.50



09/18/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim to discuss strategy for meet and confer with government.	1.00	350	\$350.00
09/19/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with J. Vail and team regarding meet and confer and electronic document.	0.25	350	\$87.50
09/19/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Multiple emails with B. Dewar and M. Goetz regarding schedule and billing practices for fee petition.	0.25	350	\$87.50
09/19/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Drafted revised government exhibit to determine bottom line numbers for fees and corresponded with D. Hallward Driemeier regarding same.	1.50	350	\$525.00
09/20/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meet and confer with J. Vail and team; follow-up discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim.	0.75	350	\$262.50
09/26/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Analyzed government objections to billing statements entry-by-entry and objected, removed, or revised as necessary.	2.50	350	\$875.00
09/27/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Corresponded with M. Goetz and B. Dewar regarding motion for attorneys' fee revisions.	0.25	350	\$87.50
09/28/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued analyzing and responding to government objections.	0.75	350	\$262.50
09/28/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued analyzing and responding to government objections to billing entry-by-entry.	2.50	350	\$875.00
09/30/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Circulated objections to team for review and revisions.	0.25	350	\$87.50
09/30/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Continued analyzing and responding to entry-by-entry objections.	2.00	350	\$700.00
10/01/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Call with A. Ripa to discuss revisions to billing entries.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/01/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding status of fee petition objections, strategy for meet and confer, and timeline.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/01/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised expense reports per B. Dewar, the Brady Project, M. Goetz, and A. Ripa.	1.25	350	\$437.50
10/02/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Multiple calls with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding revisions to fee petition (.5); revised same (.25); circulated spreadsheet to J. Vail (.25).	1.00	350	\$350.00
10/05/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Meet and confer with State, D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim (.5); follow-up meeting with team (.5); follow-up email with J. Vail circulating revised chart (.25).	1.25	350	\$437.50
10/31/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding revisions to draft motion for attorneys' fees.	0.25	350	\$87.50
10/31/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Reviewed email from opposing counsel regarding meet and confer; drafted follow-up email to opposing counsel regarding same.	0.25	350	\$87.50
11/06/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Multiple emails with D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim regarding strategy regarding same (.5); Revised motion for attorneys' fees in light of meet and confer (1.75).	2.25	350	\$787.50
11/13/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised Ropes fee exhibit to motion for attorneys' fees to address objections.	2.5	350	\$875.00
11/16/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised Asti and Brady fee spreadsheets to overcome objections.	1.0	350	\$350.00
11/19/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised motion for attorneys fees, declarations, and exhibits.	4.3	350	\$1,487.50
11/20/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Multiple emails with co-counsel regarding revisions to motion and exhibits (.25); revised motions per communications with co-counsel. (1.0)	1.3	350	\$437.50
11/27/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised motion for attorneys' fees and Mullins declaration; emailed D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding co-counsel review of motion.	0.3	350	\$87.50
11/28/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Made additional revisions to motion for fees per D. Hallward-Driemeier.	0.3	350	\$87.50
11/28/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised fee motion and declarations per D. Hallward-Driemeier and made further revisions per E. Mullins.	1.0	350	\$350.00
11/29/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding fee motion.	0.3	350	\$87.50
11/29/12	O'Connell, Kelly	ASSOCIATE	Revised exhibits to fee motion.	3.5	350	\$1,225.00
<b>Phase 7 Totals</b>				<b>97.00</b>		<b>\$33,950.00</b>

	Total Hours	Total Fee
Phase 7	121.5	\$44,450.00