

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer
ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
5/5/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Tel. Call with B. Manheim re litigation strategy and next steps (0.5); outline work to be done to proceed with complaint and preliminary injunction (.75); draft and send email to clients re case research (.25)	0.50	confer	
5/6/2011	Dina Shand	Wrote memo to Brady board regarding viability of state law claim.	0.75	confer	
5/11/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Researched and read law re: restrictions on professional speech and doctors (.5); reviewed and revised materials and discussion re interviews of doctors re impact on law for complaint and declarations (.75); met with paralegals to discuss declarations (.25)	1.00	confer	
5/11/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conference call with Florida/Brady case team (.5) and call with A.Ripa regarding strategy for complaint (.5)	1.00	confer	
5/11/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Meeting with B. Manheim, D. Hallward-Dreimeier, A. Ripa, and R. Dugas regarding Brady Campaign challenge to Florida gun law.	1.00	confer	
5/11/2011	Hallward-Dreimeier, Douglas	Call with Bruce Manheim and Brady Center attorneys regarding draft complaint and papers in support for preliminary injunction followed by meeting with Ms. Dewar, Mr. Dugas, Ms. Goetz, and Mr. Ripa regarding preparation of complaint and papers in support of injunction	1.50	confer	
5/13/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Draft outline of questions for physician declarants (1.25) and emails with R. Dugas regarding same (.25)	1.50	confer	
5/16/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Emails with R. Dugas (Ropes & Gray colleague) and Allison Finley (Florida Chapter of AAP) regarding plaintiffs (.5). Draft outline of questions for physician declarants (3.5). Prepare template for S.D. Fla. declaration papers (1.0).	0.50	confer	
5/17/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Review and comment on draft complaint in preparation for team meeting	1.50	confer	
5/17/2011	Hallward-Dreimeier, Douglas	Call with co-counsel from Brady Center regarding preparation of complaint (0.5) followed by review of correspondence with Brady Center regarding declarations (0.5) and consult with team regarding organizational plaintiffs (1.0)	2.00	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer
ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
5/17/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Follow up with J. Lowy and team regarding case status and in particular follow up on complaint and declarations being prepared by team	1.00	confer	
5/17/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Revise and edit the complaint (1.0), research law re: preliminary injunction and begin drafting the same (3.0), and participate in conference with case team re: next steps (1.0)	1.00	confer	
5/17/2011	Lewis, Julia	Spoke with M. Goetz, A. Ripa, and R. Dugas to strategize about division of labor and to determine the research agenda for the preliminary injunction, including finding an overview of grounds for preliminary injunction, meet with R. Dugas to review research needed on necessary harms required under preliminary injunction standard.	1.00	confer	
5/18/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Research re: Florida rules, discussion and research concerning client declarations (1.0); Communications with Dan V., Robyn L., Dina S., co-counsel and clients re litigation case law research and legal strategy (0.5); Tel. Con. With Bruce Manheim re suit litigation research and strategy (0.25).	0.75	confer	
5/18/2011	Daniel Vice	Strategy discussion and legal research concerning client declarations	1.50	confer	
5/18/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Consultation with team regarding draft complaint and organizational plaintiffs.	0.75	confer	
5/18/2011	Lewis, Julia	Call with E. Dewar regarding organization versus individual harms to doctors.	0.50	confer	
5/18/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Follow up with J. Lowy and team regarding status of case.	0.50	confer	
5/18/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Continue drafting complaint and coordinate with team re: venue	4.75	confer	
5/18/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with A. Ripa, M. Goetz, J. Lewis, and R. Dugas about additional research required for PI motion, including on issues of harm and organizational standing	1.50	confer	
5/19/2011	Lewis, Julia	Call with Brady intern and R. Dugas regarding physician interviews (.5)	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
5/19/2011	Lewis, Julia	Draft template physician declaration for R. Dugas (3.0). Discuss requirements for organizational plaintiffs with B. Dewar, R. Dugas, and A. Ripa. (.75)	0.75	confer	
5/19/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence relating to prep of declarations, etc (.25) followed by reviewing draft complaint (1.75) and follow up via email correspondence with team and clients (.25).	0.50	confer	
5/19/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from M.Goetz, A.Ripa, R.Dugas, and J.Lewis regarding MDs' declarations (.25); conferred with A.Ripa regarding First Amendment issues (.75).	1.00	confer	
5/20/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel concerning PI motion preparation; reviewed and revised PI motion.	0.50	confer	
5/20/2011	Daniel Vice	Communications with co-counsel concerning PI motion preparation, legal research for PI motion	0.50	confer	
5/20/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Continue to revise and edit the complaint (4.0) and met with B.Manheim and B.Dewar re: revisions (.75); coordinate with team re: venue and proper plaintiffs (.25)	5.00	confer	
5/20/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Began drafting "likelihood of success on the merits" section of PI motion (5.0); conferred with B.Manheim and A.Ripa regarding revisions to complaint (.75); conferred further with A.Ripa regarding same and regarding P.I. papers (.25).	1.00	confer	
5/23/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Review legislation, review declarations (1.0); communications with co-counsel concerning declarations, research social science concerning physician obligations and guns (0.5); research re firearms incidents and deaths in Florida and in the home (.5); revised memo of incidents (.25)	1.00	confer	
5/23/2011	Daniel Vice	Review and analyze legislation (0.5), review declarations for motion (0.5), communications with co-counsel concerning declarations (0.25), research concerning physician obligations and guns re: application of legislation (1.0)	0.25	confer	
5/23/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Analyze case law re: preliminary injunction motion and analyze facts gathered to be included in complaint; coordinate revisions of the same.	4.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer
ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
5/24/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Review, edit draft complaint and declarations; emails with co-counsel, staff re work on case and research analysis	2.25	confer	
5/24/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Telephone conference with co-counsel re case and next steps.	0.50	confer	
5/24/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Analyze facts gathered to be included in complaint; coordinate revisions of the same.	4.00	confer	
5/25/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Tel. Call with co-counsel re complaint research, litigation; review and edits complaint.	0.50	confer	
5/25/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Revised: E-mails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and A.Ripa conveying research on and analysis of issues related to facial challenges and standing (1.25); research on and analysis of 11th Circuit law regarding the same (9.50).	1.25	confer	
5/25/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Call with co-counsel at Brady regarding complaint.	0.50	confer	
5/25/2011	Lewis, Julia	Research and draft analysis of third party standing (10), discuss the same with A. Ripa and B.Dewar (.75)	0.75	confer	
5/25/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review papers (.75); draft letter to governor (.5); follow up email correspondence (.25)	0.25	confer	
5/25/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Research and draft analysis of third party standing (7.0), discuss the same with J.Lewis and B.Dewar (1.0)	1.00	confer	
5/26/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Research complaint preparations concerning logistics for filing complaint (1.0),tel. Call with co-counsel and staff about complaint, filing (1.0)	1.00	confer	
5/26/2011	Antzoulatos, Sophia	Discuss filing with B. Manheim (.25); Review SD Fla rules and determine filing requirements for Complaint. (1.0)	0.25	confer	
5/26/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding local counsel and colleagues admitted to S.D. Fla..	0.50	confer	
5/26/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Confer with Mr. Manheim and Ms. Dewar regarding necessary steps to prepare for filing of complaint and preliminary injunction motion.	0.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer
ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
5/26/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Review draft physician declaration (.5) and confer with Ms. Dewar re preliminary injunction motion (.25).	0.25	confer	
5/26/2011	Lewis, Julia	Calls with B. Dewar and A. Ripa regarding additional research questions and status of declarations (1.0); revise Wollschlaeger declaration to reflect B. Dewar's suggestions regarding hypothetical example of chill and issue of consent for recording gun information in medical chart (2.25)	1.00	confer	
5/26/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Draft demand/notice letter to Governor Scott; circulate to group for review and approval.	2.50	confer	
5/26/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence with team regarding Governor Scott letter.	0.50	confer	
5/26/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Telephone conference with B. Dewar and D. Hallward-Driemer regarding next steps in case.	0.50	confer	
5/26/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon regarding further research on preliminary injunction standard in Eleventh Circuit.	0.50	confer	
5/27/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Research (3.5) and e-mails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, S. Lemmon, and A.Ripa regarding standing issues and also preliminary injunction standards (1.25).	1.25	confer	
5/27/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Finalize letter to Gov. Scott (.75); email correspondence with team regarding local counsel (.75); telephone conference with K. Crumbley regarding AAP position (1.0)	1.75	confer	
5/27/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Telephone call with H. Lucas regarding Florida Ped. case and filings as local counsel.	0.75	confer	
5/27/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Telephone conference with H. Lucas regarding local counsel, etc.	0.50	confer	
5/29/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Reviewed S.Lemmon memorandum on vagueness and overbreadth (.25); researched further and drafted vagueness section of preliminary injunction motion (3.0); revised complaint to reflect research on vagueness claim (0.5).	0.25	confer	
5/30/2011	Edward Mullins	Conference with B. Manheim regarding strategy, status of case	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer
ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
5/30/2011	Hal Lucas	Telephonic conference with B. Manheim and E. Mullins re: new matter.	0.40	confer	
5/30/2011	Lewis, Julia	Email Dr. Drusano regarding setting up an interview and R. Dugas regarding status of physician interviews.	0.25	confer	
5/31/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Discussions with clients concerning complaint filing, final preparations for complaint filing (0.75); communications with co-counsel re edits/additions to complaint, filing (0.5).	1.25	confer	
5/31/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Discussion with Bruce Manheim regarding filing logistics and timing of preliminary injunction motion.	0.25	confer	
5/31/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with A.Ripa regarding impact of Rust v. Sullivan, overbreadth issue, and motion for preliminary injunction (.5); researched cases on Rust v. Sullivan issue (1.0); began drafting memorandum to D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding same (0.75).	1.25	confer	
6/1/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Tel. call with co-counsel re compliant, filing, strategy.	0.25	confer	
6/1/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Concluded drafting memorandum regarding impact of Rust v. Sullivan on First Amendment claim.	0.75	confer	
6/1/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Confer with team re: next steps in case; analyze materials necessary for revisions of PI motion; coordinate the same	4.50	confer	
6/2/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence regarding status of suit; correspond with B. Manheim in strategy	0.20	confer	
6/2/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conference call with D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, R.Dugas, A.Ripa, and J.Lewis regarding case status, preliminary injunction motion, the complaint, and organizations' declarations.	1.00	confer	
6/3/2011	Lewis, Julia	Research service of process issue and discuss with team and local counsel.	1.00	confer	
6/3/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Confer with team re: next steps in revisions to complaint; effectuate the same; analyze documents for fact-citations in complaint	4.00	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer
ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/3/2011	Lewis, Julia	Call with Dr. Schaecter regarding revising her declaration, with Dr. Ramon-Coton regarding her views on HB 155 and setting up an interview, and with Ropes team and plaintiffs to discuss status of lawsuit.	3.25	confer	
6/4/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re: case analysis and litigation strategy	0.50	confer	
6/4/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Numerous e-mails to/from/among D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and clients regarding clients' proposed changes to draft complaint (.75); conferred twice with Dr. Louis St. Petery regarding revisions to complaint (.75) and worked with the Ropes team to integrate suggestions (.75)	1.50	confer	
6/5/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re: case preparation and litigation strategy	0.50	confer	
6/6/2011	Aida Rodriguez	Research correct names and addresses of State of Florida officials to be served (1.0); research names and addresses of Florida Board of Medicine members (1.0); locate process server in Tallahassee with experience serving government officials (0.5); telephone conference with process server (0.4); prepare letter to process server enclosing fee and summonses to be served with specific instructions regarding same (1.0); confer with E. Mullins on tasks (0.5).	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer
ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/6/2011	Edward Mullins	Work on final preparations for filing (.3); edit and revise final draft complaint; correspond with clients on same (.4); correspond with legal team on filing requirements (.3); work on service issues (.1); provide law on privilege (.3); conference with co-counsel regarding judge, procedures (.6); investigate service procedures (.3); conference with counsel regarding same (.4); numerous calls and conferences to general counsel offices of defendants (1.0); update E. Dewar on same (.7); task A. Rodriguez on project on analyzing location of administrative authority (.2); task E. Davila on service projects (.1); correspond with B. Manheim on strategy (.3); correspond with team on amendment strategy (.2); edit and revise certificate of interested persons (.2); send draft of same to team (.1)	2.20	confer	
6/6/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Worked with D. Hallward-Driemeier, E.Mullins, T.Schechtman, and J.Schaechter, to conclude implementing final revisions to complaint and declarations.	8.00	confer	
6/6/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Conference call with B. DeWar, R. Dugas, J. Lewis and S. Lemmon regarding complaint, declarations, and preliminary injunction papers. (.25) Review and comment on same. (.75)	1.00	confer	
6/6/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence with team (.25) and review of declarations and complaint (.75).	1.00	confer	
6/7/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Review and analyze motion; Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy and research	1.25	confer	
6/7/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with D. Hallward regarding conference with C. Trippe (.1);	0.10	confer	
6/7/2011	Hal Lucas	Revise and finalize Rule 7.1 disclosure statement and certificate of interested parties (0.3); correspondence to legal team re: same (0.1).	0.10	confer	
6/7/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Emails with R. Dugas, J. Lewis and B. DeWar regarding doctor declarations, organizational declarations, preliminary injunction papers, and ongoing issues.	1.00	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer
ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/7/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Coordinate with team on plaintiffs, declarations (.25); legal research re: preliminary injunction (2.75)	0.25	confer	
6/8/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with clients concerning complaint follow-up (0.75); Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation (0.5)	0.50	confer	
6/8/2011	Edward Mullins	conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding strategy (.3); conference with C. Trippe on case (.3); correspond with team on standing issues (.3); correspond on research for same (.2); work on issues of new plaintiff (.2); correspond with team on plaintiff strategy (.3)	1.10	confer	
6/8/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Call with counsel to Governor regarding proper defendant. (.5) Consultation with team regarding possible amendment of complaint to add new plaintiffs and defendants and/or drop defendants. (.75) Review of research regarding head of agency suits. (1.75)	0.75	confer	
6/8/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Drafted declaration for R. Gutierrez (4.5), revised draft FACP declaration and draft FAFP declaration (.5). E-mails to/from E.Mullins regarding attorney-client privilege issue (.5) and to/from entire R&G associate team regarding additional declarants and plaintiffs (.5)	1.00	confer	
6/9/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy and research	0.50	confer	
6/9/2011	Edward Mullins	Review research regarding Secretary of State as defendant (.1); Update team on service status (.2); work on issues (.1); conference with D. Kanine on status (.4); update team (.1); work on obtaining amicus counsel (.5); correspond with team on draft status (.1); correspond with team on amicus participation (.1); correspond with T. Julin on same (.1); correspond with Ropes firm on strategy (.2); correspond on issue with respect to plaintiff (.2); correspond with T. Julin on recent Supreme Court cases involving speech (.2)	1.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/9/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	With assistance from M. Goetz, revised draft Gutierrez, Herman and L. Goodman draft declaration (3.75); email to D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim regarding declarants (.25)	4.00	confer	
6/10/2011	Edward Mullins	Review status of service (.1); review rules on service after summons (.1); review reports on pending Supreme Court cases (.2); correspond with Ropes on various issues in the case (.5); conference with Ropes on strategy (.5); task A. Rodriguez on legislative history (.2); review legislative history of bills (.3); correspond with E. Dewar on strategy (.2); send procedures on Judge Cooke to team (.1)	1.50	confer	
6/10/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Interview doctors and prepare declarations (5.0). Emails with team regarding status of doctors and case strategy (.5). Revise organizational declarations and emails with team regarding same in response. (3.25)	0.50	confer	
6/10/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Participated in conference call with B. Dewar and M. Goetz regarding adding new defendants to amended complaint.	0.25	confer	
6/10/2011	Lewis, Julia	Call with Dr. Fox re: revisions to declaration followed by interview with Dr. Fox (3.0); revise/draft Fox, and Edwards declaration (2.0). Conference calls with team to discuss timeline for filing amended complaint (1.0), followed by update to the physician spreadsheet (1.0).	1.00	confer	
6/10/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Confer with team re: Dr. Gutierrez declaration revisions	0.50	confer	
6/11/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with Ropes team on amicus (.2); correspond with A. Finley on same (.1)	0.30	confer	
6/11/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Reviewed C. Dulis research on Supremacy Clause issue; e-mail to R&G team regarding same;	0.50	confer	
6/11/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Reviewed draft Fox-Levine declaration (.25); e-mails to/from J. Lewis regarding same (.5)	0.50	confer	
6/11/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Work on physician declarations (3.0). Emails with team regarding declarations and PI. (.5)	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/11/2011	Lewis, Julia	Draft emails to D. Hallward-Driemeier summarizing Goodman, Edwards, and Fox declarations (1.25). Draft sections of complaint describing the impact of the new law on Drs. Edwards and Fox's practices (1.0). Draft Dr. King declaration. (1.0)	3.25	confer	
6/11/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Revise Dr. Gutierrez declaration (3.0); analyze claims against agency responsible for health care facilities (1.5); confer with team on next steps (.5)	0.50	confer	
6/12/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy and legal research	0.50	confer	
6/12/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from R.Dugas regarding Welty interview and declaration (.10); emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier and R.Dugas regarding case status and timing (.15); e-mails to/from A.Ripa regarding edits to Gutierrez declaration and call (.25); e-mail to R.Gutierrez regarding call (.25).	0.75	confer	
6/12/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Confer with team re: Dr. Gutierrez declaration revisions; effectuate the same	3.00	confer	
6/13/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Review communications from clients re litigation strategy and research (0.25), research concerning gag rule implementation (1.25); Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation, research (0.25)	0.25	confer	
6/13/2011	Edward Mullins	Review and make suggestions to team regarding affidavit of R. Gutierrez (.5); review preliminary injunction memorandum and provide comments (2.0); correspond with K. Crumley on procedures (.3); correspond with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding amendment, preliminary injunction memorandum (.2); send thoughts on preliminary injunction to team (.1); correspond with D. Hallward-Driemeier on plaintiff issue (.1); correspond with T. Julin on amicus issue (.1); review summary memo of status (.1)	3.10	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/13/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Draft and revise physician declarations (3.5), emails with Dr. Leland and Dr. Stewart (.25). Team meeting regarding amended complaint and preliminary injunction papers (1.0). Emails with team regarding declarations, amended complaint, and outstanding action items (.25). Discuss HIPAA issue. (.25)	1.50	confer	
6/13/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Attended meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier, E. Dewar, J. Lewis, R. Dugas, M. Goetz, and A. Ripa to discuss steps needed to finalize complaint and motion for preliminary injunction.	1.00	confer	
6/13/2011	Lewis, Julia	Meet with team to review items to be completed before filing amended complaint and preliminary injunction.	2.00	confer	
6/14/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy and research	0.25	confer	
6/14/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with D. Hallward-Driemeier on arguments for motion (.3); work on arguments for motion regarding discrimination prong (.2); edit and revised Amended Complaint (.8); correspond with E. Dewar on standing orders (.1); send Amended Complaint draft to team (.1); work on scheduling meeting regarding general counsels (.1)	0.40	confer	
6/14/2011	Hal Lucas	Telephonic conference with Michael Sevi (0.3); follow-up email and telephonic communications with Ropes & Gray attorneys and E. Mullins (0.3).	0.60	confer	
6/14/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon and A.Ripa regarding additional research on Defendant Dudek's powers and revisions to complaint incorporating same.	2.00	confer	
6/14/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Prepared clean draft of amended complaint and redline for circulation to local counsel (.75); numerous e-mails to/from E.Mullins, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding complaint, revisions thereto, and strategy, particularly the discrimination provision (5.75).	5.75	confer	
6/14/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Emails with team regarding declarations and amended complaint (.25). Confer with J. Lewis regarding plaintiff-MDs HIPAA obligations as related to case. (.25)	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/14/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Conducted research and drafted memo with A. Ripa describing the defendants named in complaint and why they are proper defendants.	3.00	confer	
6/14/2011	Lewis, Julia	Discuss with M. Goetz and team whether defendants would be able to request patient medical records under HIPAA in relation to case (1.25); left voicemail to Dr. Fox regarding her questions about disclosure of patients' records under HIPAA and timing of discovery. (.25)	1.50	confer	
6/14/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Analyze applicable Florida statues and regulatory code provisions (2.0); coordinate revisions of documents to be filed with case team (.25); call with Dr. Gutierrez and D.Hallward-Dreimier (.75)	1.00	confer	
6/15/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients concerning amendments, litigation strategy	0.75	confer	
6/15/2011	Aida Rodriguez	Telephone conference with Florida Senate document center regarding recordings of committee meetings (0.3); prepare letter to Florida Senate requesting CD of recordings (0.3); conduct search for House committee meetings (0.2); confer with E. Mullins regarding same (0.2); prepare detailed memo to team identifying process for tracking and downloading podcasts of House committee meetings (0.6).	0.80	confer	
6/15/2011	Edward Mullins	Pre-meeting with legal team (.5); attend meeting with defense counsel (1.0); attend meeting post-meeting briefing on strategy (.5); review letter from C. Smith (.1); correspond with Ropes team on same (.1)	2.20	confer	
6/15/2011	Hal Lucas	Telephonic conferences with E. Mullins and co-counsel (Ropes & Gray) (0.3); telephonic conference with attorneys for various Departments/Offices/Agencies of the State of Florida (1.0); review correspondence from Chesterfield Smith and Doug Hallward-Driemeier (0.2).	1.50	confer	
6/15/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Concluded revising amended complaint for circulation to co-counsel (5.0) and drafted email to co-counsel explaining certain strategic changes for amended complaint (.5).	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/15/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Discuss with Mr. Ripa enforcement responsibilities of each defendant vis-a-vis gag law. (.5) Review statutory and regulatory provisions relating to enforcement responsibilities. (1.25)	0.50	confer	
6/15/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Prepare for an participate in call with counsel for defendants about possible amended complaint adding and deleting parties. (.5) Follow up with associates regarding addition of Board of Medicine. (.5)	0.50	confer	
6/15/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Coordinate revisions of documents to be filed with case team (.5); analyze proper defendants in preparation for 2pm call with state counsel and attended call (2.0)	2.50	confer	
6/16/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with B. Dewar on legislative history (.1); review edits to letter by C. Smith made by Ropes team (.1); conference with Ropes team on motion (.1); correspond with B. Dewar on proposed order (.1)	0.40	confer	
6/16/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence from C. Smith, comments regarding same	0.20	confer	
6/17/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation research, resolutions	0.75	confer	
6/17/2011	Edward Mullins	Review equal protection argument with respect to first amendment (.3); attend meeting with clients on case (0.6); correspond with team on filing under seal (.2); correspond with team on briefing (.2); correspond with team on caption (.1); review amended complaint (.2); send orders to C. Smith (.2); review proposed order (.2); comment to B. Dewar regarding same (.1); correspond with T. Julin as amicus (.1); correspond with B. Manheim on same (.1)	1.40	confer	
6/17/2011	Hal Lucas	Review scheduling order and U.S. Magistrate Judge referral order (0.2); attend telephonic conference with co-counsel and clients re: next steps (0.6); correspondence with co-counsel re: procedure to request filing under seal (0.1); review correspondence to Chesterfield Smith (0.1).	0.70	confer	
6/17/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conference call with clients regarding PI motion and next steps;	1.00	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/17/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Participated in conference call with Ropes & Gray team, Brady Center, and plaintiffs.	1.00	confer	
6/17/2011	Lewis, Julia	Confirm with R. Dugas status of declarations for Goodman, King, Fox, and Edwards (.25). Call with Dr. King regarding revisions to declaration and revise King declaration (.5). Call Dr. Edwards to check on status of original and scanned versions of signature page (.25)	0.25	confer	
6/18/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with Ropes team, T. Julin regarding amicus strategy, procedure (.5)	0.50	confer	
6/18/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Emails with team regarding Board of Medicine defendants and case developments.	1.00	confer	
6/19/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy and research	0.25	confer	
6/19/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Implemented proposed revisions by J.Schaechter to her declaration and further revised declaration (1.75); numerous e-mails to/from J.Schaechter regarding additional revisions to declaration and logistics for transmitting signed copy (.25); emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding Schaechter declaration (.25)	0.50	confer	
6/19/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Implemented revisions to PI motion regarding FACP public health stance (1.0); conferred with R.Dugas regarding additional revisions to implement in PI motion (.75); reviewed and further revised (.25)	0.75	confer	
6/19/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Attention to physician declarations. (1.0) Emails with team regarding case. (.5)	0.50	confer	
6/20/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with B. Dewar on status of filings (.2); review status of meeting (.1); attend strategy meeting with T. Julin, Ropes firm (.9); review letter from C. Smith (.1); correspond with Ropes team on responding to NRA (.1); review recent USSC cases, correspond with Ropes team on matter of public concern law (.4)	1.70	confer	
6/20/2011	Antzoulatos, Sophia	Discuss upcoming filing with team.	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/20/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from E.Mullins regarding logistics for filing complaint and PI (.5); revised PI page by page to reduce length by 6 pages toward 20-page limit (8.0); conferred with A.Ripa regarding same (.25).	0.75	confer	
6/20/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from N.Han regarding research on penalties under the "failure to perform legal obligation" guideline (1.0); e-mail to entire R&G team regarding results of N.Han research (1.0); emails to/from S.Lemmon, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding impact of recently decided Supreme Court cases (1.0).	3.00	confer	
6/20/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Attention to physician declarations. (3.0) Emails with team regarding PI motion (1.0). Confer with R. Dugas regarding declarations. (.5) Review and comment on PI motion. (1.0)	2.50	confer	
6/20/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence with clients.	1.00	confer	
6/21/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with Ropes team regarding NRA position and gun safety (.2); review correspondence regarding amicus (.1)	0.30	confer	
6/21/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	PI motion work: continued revising PI to reduce length to 20-page limit (3.0); conferred with A.Ripa regarding additional revisions to PI motion regarding the legislative history and to reduce it in length (1.0); e-mail to D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim regarding legislative history issue (.5); conferred with S.Antzoulatos regarding cite-check of PI memorandum (.5)	2.00	confer	
6/21/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Review and finalize physician declarations (2.0). Emails with team regarding PI motion (.25). Edits to PI motion and First Amended Complaint (2.5).	4.75	confer	
6/22/2011	Edward Mullins	Review amended complaint (1.0); extensive conversation with B. Dewar on same (.5); correspond with team on same (.2); edit and revise preliminary injunction motion (1.5); conference with R. Dewar on legislative analysis (.4); correspond with same on same (.1); correspond with E. Dewar regarding edits (.1)	1.30	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/23/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with E. Palmer and A. Rodriguez regarding legislative history (.2); correspond with team on finalizing motion (.2); task H. Lucas, D. Giuliano on logistics (.2); work on finalizing filing (.4)	1.00	confer	
6/23/2011	Antzoulatos, Sophia	Call local counsel to discuss filing (.5); prepare declarations for distribution and e-filing (1.75); enter edits into brief (.75)	0.50	confer	
6/23/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mail to D.Vice regarding Brady Center edits (.25); performed final reviews of and implemented final technical and substantive revisions to PI motion and amended complaint before filing (6.0); numerous e-mails to/from local counsel and S.Antzoulatos regarding exhibits and logistics for filing (.25); numerous e-mails to/from B.Manheim and D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding IMS v. Sorrell decision and related potential revisions to PI motion (1.5)	2.00	confer	
6/23/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review draft pleadings (.75), email correspondence (.25), teleconferences re finalization of amended complaint (1.0).	2.00	confer	
6/24/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Review final case filings (1.0); Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy and research (.75)	0.75	confer	
6/24/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence on enlargement (.2); correspond with Ropes team on same, magistrate issue (.3); work on request for oral argument (.1); finalize filings (.2); work on proposed order (.2)	0.50	confer	
6/24/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding final revision to amended complaint (.25); implemented revision and sent to local counsel (.25)	0.25	confer	
6/24/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with D.Hallward-Driemeier and H.Lucas regarding proposed order, summonses, and logistics for and manner of filing complaint, motion, and declarations (1.0); e-mails to/from A.Ripa and J.Broxmeyer regarding proposed order (.25); revised draft proposed order (.5); implemented D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim edits to proposed order (.25)	1.25	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/24/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Draft and revise request for hearing; confer with team re: preliminary injunction edits and filing.	1.50	confer	
6/27/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Research opposition to NRA motion to intervene legal standard, review co-counsel communications (1.0); Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy, legal analysis and research (0.25)	1.25	confer	
6/27/2011	Daniel Vice	Research opposition to NRA motion to intervene (2.5), co-counsel communications concerning opposition strategy (.75)	0.75	confer	
6/27/2011	Edward Mullins	Review final motion for preliminary injunction (.2); prepare for meeting with J. Vail (.1); correspond with B. Manheim regarding preliminary injunction procedures (.1); attend meeting with Governor's office (.6); review recent Supreme Court case (.1); conference with J. Vail on service, task E. Davlia (.1); work on strategy on motion to intervene (.4); conference with T. Julin on strategy (.2); review motion to intervene (.2); conference with E. Dewar on strategy (.2); review orders on briefing, scheduling (.2); conference with D. Hallward-Driemeier on strategy (.2); conference with T. Julin on amicus (.2); conference with T. Julin, D. Hallward-Driemeier on same (.2)	1.20	confer	
6/27/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence re NRA motion to intervene (.5) and telephone conference with counsel for state regarding timing and schedule of briefing in case (1.0)	1.50	confer	
6/28/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy, legal analysis and research	0.25	confer	
6/28/2011	Aida Rodriguez	Conduct search on House and Senate website regarding accessibility to floor debates regarding House Bill #155 (0.5); prepare detailed email to E. Dewars regarding same (0.3).	0.30	confer	
6/28/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Discussions with Mr. Manheim and Ms. Dewar research in anticipation of reply brief in support of PI.	0.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
6/28/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Read Defendants' response to the NRA's motion to intervene and emails to/from E.Mullins, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding responding to same.	2.00	confer	
6/29/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy, legal analysis and research	0.50	confer	
6/29/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with B. Manheim regarding mock argument (.2); review correspondence regarding Board of Medicine directive, correspond with team on same (.2)	0.40	confer	
6/29/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with J.Broxmeyer regarding preliminary results of research on professional speech issue.	0.50	confer	
6/29/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from B.Manheim, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and J.Becker regarding floor debates and committee meeting hearings (.25); conferred with J.Broxmeyer regarding preliminary results of research on professional speech issue (.25).	0.50	confer	
6/30/2011	Edward Mullins	Review response to motion to intervene (.2); correspond with B. Manheim on strategy of pages (.2); correspond with E. Dewar regarding response to intervention (.2); correspond with B. Manheim on same (.1); edit and revise same (.9); send same to team (.1)	0.60	confer	
6/30/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Read Eleventh Circuit case law on mandatory and permissive intervention and drafted numerous e-mails and conferences to/from/with B.Manheim, E.Mullins, and S.Lemmon regarding opposition to intervention.	5.00	confer	
6/30/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review and revise draft memo from Brady regarding opposition to NRA intervention; email correspondence with team, etc.	1.50	confer	
6/30/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Telephone conference with B. Dewar regarding intervention papers (.5); additional revisions (1.0).	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/1/2011	Edward Mullins	Work on finalizing response to motion to intervene (.3); correspond with D. Vice on same (.1); conference with E. Dewar on same (.1); edit and revise final draft (.3); send to team (.1); finalize same (.1); correspond with B. Manheim, B. Dewar on enlargement strategy (.2); correspond with B. Manheim on strategy (.2); work on strategy with respect to amicus (.2); review correspondence on same (.1)	0.70	confer	
7/1/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Discussed captive audience doctrine, ripeness, and other issues with B. Manheim, J. Lewis, D. Hallward-Driemeier, B. Dewar, and J. Broxmeyer.	0.75	confer	
7/1/2011	Lewis, Julia	Conference call with B. Manheim and team regarding research in preparation for response to defendants' opposition to motion for preliminary injunction.	1.00	confer	
7/1/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review memos prepared by J. Lewis and J. Broxmeyer regarding government arguments.	1.00	confer	
7/1/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Meeting with team regarding response to government and NRA opposition.	1.00	confer	
7/1/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Readied opposition to NRA intervention for filing by various e-mail to team, a review of J.Lewis memorandum on justiciability issues, and a conference with with E.Mullins. N.Han, B. Manheim, D.Hallward-Driemeier on legislative history/related issues.	3.50	confer	
7/1/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Emails with team regarding NRA Opposition (.25). Review draft Opposition (.5)	0.25	confer	
7/2/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with clients, co-counsel re: hearing	0.50	confer	
7/2/2011	Daniel Vice	Communications with clients, co-counsel re: hearing preparation and strategy	0.25	confer	
7/2/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence on resolution by Florida Medical Association	0.20	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/5/2011	Edward Mullins	Review motion to file amicus (.2); correspond with team on same (.1); correspond with team on State's violation of the court order (.1); review response to preliminary injunction motion (.3); review response by State to preliminary injunction motion (1.0); prepare memorandum to team on same (.5); edit and revise response to motion for leave to file amicus (.5); conference with E. Dewar on legislative history (.1); finalize filing (.2); review reply to response on intervention (.2)	0.80	confer	
7/5/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Read and analyzed State's and NRA's oppositions to PI (.5), and conferred with B.Manheim, D.Hallward-Driemeier, J. Borxmeyer and R&G team regarding strategy for PI reply brief. (.5)	0.50	confer	
7/5/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with J.Broxmeyer regarding professional speech arguments and outline of brief (1.0); reviewed transcribed portions of Senate floor debates in connection to same (3.0)	1.00	confer	
7/5/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Review and analyze preliminary injunction papers and draft counterarguments to state and NRA opposition briefs and emails with team regarding state's opposition arguments.	6.00	confer	
7/5/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Team meeting to discuss reply brief.	1.00	confer	
7/5/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Call with team to discuss reply to Florida and NRA briefs.	1.00	confer	
7/5/2011	Lewis, Julia	Meet with team to discuss defendant's opposition to our motion for a preliminary injunction and our strategy for drafting a reply brief.	1.00	confer	
7/5/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Conference call with local counsel regarding PI motion (.5); email correspondence regarding same .25); follow up with team regarding same. (.25)	1.00	confer	
7/5/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Participated in conference call to discuss Florida and NRA filings.	1.25	confer	
7/6/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy, legal analysis and research	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/6/2011	Aida Rodriguez	Conduct multiple telephone conferences with House and Senate public records departments to obtain all recordings of all floor debates involving House Bill #155 (1.5); confer with E. Mullins and E. Dewar regarding same (.3).	0.30	confer	
7/6/2011	Edward Mullins	Review NRA amicus brief (1.0); correspond with team on live testimony issue (.2); work on obtaining House floor debate (.2); send memorandum to team on NRA brief (.5)	0.70	confer	
7/6/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Research and draft vagueness section of reply brief (9.5) and conference and e-mails with team regarding same (.75).	0.75	confer	
7/6/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Review team correspondence and emails on current issues in PI reply.	0.50	confer	
7/6/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from B.Manheim regarding NRA reply in support of intervention (.5); read portions of legislative history cited in State brief and spoke to N. Han regarding further investigations required due to erroneous State citation (5.0); read and discussed S.Lemmon memorandum regarding captive audience issue (1.5)	10.00	confer	
7/7/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with B. Manheim on arrangements (.1); conference with law clerk regarding procedures (.2); update B. Manheim (.2); work on motion for more pages (.2); task E. Davila on same (.2); review correspondence on strategy (.1); revise motion for more pages (.5); send draft of same to B. Manheim (.1); review changes of B. Manheim, finalize same (.1)	0.80	confer	
7/7/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Emails with team regarding cases for PI and emails from doctors regarding PI hearing and recent experiences.	0.25	confer	
7/7/2011	Ripa, Augustine	Review team correspondence and emails on current issues in PI reply.	0.50	confer	
7/7/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding preparation for oral argument.	0.50	confer	
7/8/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Review PI motion and emails with team regarding same.	0.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/8/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Call with Mr. Manheim, Ms. Dewar, and Mr. Dugas to discuss revised reply to PI motion.	0.50	confer	
7/8/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Phone conference with B. Manheim, A. Ripa regarding plans for Reply to State's Motion to Revise Styling of Case (caption).	0.50	confer	
7/8/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Correspondence with S. Lemmon and K. O'Connell regarding filings.	1.00	confer	
7/11/2011	Edward Mullins	Edit and revise response to motion to change case style (.5); revise same to include letter exhibits (.2); revise response per changes of B. Manheim (.3); edit response regarding same with changes of B. Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier (.2); call to judge's chambers (.1); update team on same (.1); correspond with team on amici request of children's groups (.1); correspond with G. Greenberg on same (.1); conference with G. Greenberg on strategy (.1); update B. Manheim on same (.1); review order on caption (.1); review amended order denying intervention (.1); attend mock oral argument (1.5); correspond with team on Judge Cooke arguments (.2)	0.50	caption confer	
7/11/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Prepared for D.Hallward-Driemeier moot argument for PI hearing on 7/13/11 by conferring with D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding outstanding key issues for PI argument (1.0) and by revising and annotating case materials in preparation for oral argument (3.5); conferred with S.Antzoulatos regarding preparing additional materials for argument. (.25)	0.25	hearing confer	
7/11/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Confer with B. Dewar and A. Ripa about PI hearing and moot court preparation.	3.00	hearing confer	
7/11/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Meeting with team regarding preparation for PI hearing; review additional cases.	3.25	hearing confer	
7/12/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with Dan V., co-counsel and clients re litigation strategy (0.5), legal analysis and research (3.5)	0.25	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/12/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with E. Dewar on responses due to the Amended Complaint (.1);	0.60	confer	
7/12/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with D.Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim concerning strategy for oral argument and issues to be addressed (.50) as well as annotated materials for argument (.25); prepared annotated copies of statute, Board of Medicine letter, and Board of Medicine minutes for D.Hallward-Driemeier use at argument. (.25)	0.50	confer hearing	
7/12/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Meeting with E. Mullins regarding preliminary injunction hearing.	2.00	confer hearing	
7/13/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Met with D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and E.Mullins following oral argument to outline supplemental submission to court.	0.50	confer	
7/14/2011	Jonathon Lowy	Communications with staff, co-counsel and clients re hearing, litigation	0.75	confer	
7/14/2011	Edward Mullins	Assist amicus with transcript (.2); review transcript for memorandum (.3); work on strategy with team (.3); work on outline (.3)	0.30	confer	
7/14/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Drafted outline of supplemental submission and necessary supplemental research necessary (4.0); worked with co-counsel and team regarding same (.75)	0.75	confer	
7/14/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Review transcript from PI hearing and emails with B. Dewar regarding outline for supplemental briefing (5.25). Team meeting regarding supplemental briefing strategy (1.0).	1.00	confer	
7/14/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Meeting with B. Manheim, E. Dewar, J. Lewis, R. Dugas, A. Ripa to discuss additional briefing to draft in wake of hearing on Motion for Preliminary Injunction.	1.00	confer	
7/14/2011	Lewis, Julia	Prepared for and participated in meeting with B. Manheim and Florida Gun Law Associates to discuss preparation of supplemental briefing on preliminary injunction motion.	5.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/14/2011	Lewis, Julia	Research cases for B. Dewar indicating that courts should look to a statute's legislative history and legislative purpose in determining whether the statute is viewpoint-discriminatory and drafted email to B. Manheim and D. Hallward-Driemeier analyzing same.	3.00	confer	
7/14/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Additional email correspondence with team regarding analysis.	1.00	confer	
7/14/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Attend meeting with litigation team regarding next steps in preparation of supplemental brief, in light of oral argument.	1.50	confer	
7/14/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Prepare stat analysis outline for brief; forward to team.	1.50	confer	
7/15/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond on strategy in case	0.20	confer	
7/15/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with J.Schaechter and B.Manheim regarding issue with respect to potential materials for submission with supplemental memorandum.	1.00	confer	
7/15/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Confer with B. Dewar regarding supplemental briefing issues.	0.75	confer	
7/16/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with team on evidentiary issues (.2); work on revising declaration (.1)	0.20	confer	
7/16/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Emails to/from B.Manheim and D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding supplemental submission; revised draft supplemental submission per D.Hallward-Driemeier and B.Manheim comments.	4.00	confer	
7/17/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence from T. Julin regarding amicus (.1); correspond with T. Julin on same (.1); review amicus (.5); correspond with T. Julin on same (.1); correspond with counsel regarding same (.1); correspond with T. Julin on arguments (.3)	0.70	confer	
7/17/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Draft and revise declarations for Schaechter, Schechtman, and Wollschlaeger, and emails with team regarding same.	3.75	confer	
7/18/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with counsel regarding edits to amicus brief (.5); review message from CHILD and update amici team on same (.2); work on revisions to declaration (.1)	0.70	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/18/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Numerous substantive e-mails to/from J.Lewis, B.Manheim, and D.Hallward-Driemeier regarding proposed revisions to supplemental submission (.5); conferred with J.Lewis regarding revisions to submission. (.25)	0.75	confer	
7/18/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Continued drafting and revision of supplemental brief . (2.0) Review supplemental draft declarations (1.0); follow up with team on revisions to brief (.5); meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding same. (.5)	1.00	confer	
7/19/2011	Edward Mullins	Edit and revise supplemental briefing (1.5); review motion for leave to file amicus (.1); work on finalizing filing (.1); review order on amicus (.1); review state's supplemental brief (.3); meet with team same (.2); finalize same (.3)	0.20	confer	
7/19/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with B.Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier, E. Mullins, D. Vice, and J. Lewis regarding additional revisions to supplemental brief and implemented those revisions (2.5); conferred with J.Lewis regarding same (.50); e-mails to/from S.Lemmon regarding additional research on legislative history issue (.50).	3.50	confer	
7/19/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from M.Goetz, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding additional edits to declarations.	0.25	confer	
7/19/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Revise multiple physician declarations (.75) and conference call with Judy Schaechter regarding declaration edits (.5). Emails with team regarding supplemental declarations and briefing issues. (.25).	0.25	confer	
7/19/2011	Lewis, Julia	Correspond with B. Dewar, D. Hallward-Driemeier, and B. Manheim to draft and revise supplemental brief in support for motion for preliminary injunction, including finding missing citations, rewriting paragraphs, entering team edits, proofreading, and reworking in light of Defendants' supplemental filing.	8.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/19/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review and revise brief with D. Hallward-Driemer to incorporate Brady and Mullins firm comments. (4.0) Review draft brief from DJD (1.0); email correspondence with co-counsel from Brady and Mullins firms (.5). Redraft and revise supplemental brief to address State supplemental filing and revised BOM letter. (5.0)	0.50	confer	
7/20/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence regarding status from D. Hallward-Driemeier (.2); correspond with same regarding strategy (.2)	0.40	confer	
7/20/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Emails with team regarding supplemental briefing and additional developments in case.	1.50	confer	
7/20/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Correspond with team on government brief and supplemental brief, and Toole letter. (1.5) Additional email correspondence regarding next steps and reports to clients. (.5)	2.00	confer	
7/21/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence regarding PI issuance and other related issues (.5); Review FL Constitution and FL Supreme Court certification issues. (.5) Correspond regarding next steps with co-counsel and D. Hallward-Driemeier. (.5)	1.50	confer	
7/22/2011	Edward Mullins	Review status of letters from Ropes changing status (.1); review response to motion for leave to file amicus (.1); correspond with T. Julin on same (.1)	0.20	confer	
7/25/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with B. Manheim regarding having fact that letter not sent given to Court (.1); conference with S. Lemmon on same (.1); edit and revise declaration (.1)	0.20	confer	
7/25/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Numerous emails to/from S.Lemmon regarding drafting and information for supplementary declarations regarding failure of board of medicine to advise physicians of rescind letter (.25); conferred with S.Lemmon regarding declarations (.25); emails to/from E.Mullins and S.Lemmon regarding proposed revisions to language of declaration; revised motion to supplement record. (.25)	0.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/25/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Discussed motion for leave to file supplemental declarations with D. Hallward-Driemeier.	0.50	confer	
7/25/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence in connection with impending Preliminary Injunction Decision. (.25) Review draft supplemental papers and declarations prepared by S. Lemmon. (1.0)	0.25	confer	
7/26/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and E.Mullins regarding content of, and whether to file, additional supplemental declarations in response to clients' not having received copies of updated Tootle letter.	0.25	confer	
7/26/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Discussions with Mr. Manheim and Mr. Lemmon regarding possible supplemental filing regarding BOM's failure to notify doctors of July 18 letter.	0.50	confer	
7/26/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review state's Motion to Strike Supplemental Memo (.25); follow up email correspondence regarding response. (.25) Additional email correspondence regarding state's Motion to Strike. (.5)	0.75	confer	
7/27/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Read State's motion to strike (.1); emails to/from E.Mullins and B.Manheim regarding response thereto. (.15)	0.15	confer	
7/28/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence regarding case and related matters.	0.50	confer	
8/10/2011	Edward Mullins	Conference with Senate staff person on status of case (.2); update team on same (.2); review order on enlargement (.1).	0.20	confer	
8/11/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Read and provided comments on draft motion to strike (.25); emails to/from R.Dugas and S.Lemmon regarding further revisions to same (.25); reviewed R.Dugas edits and provided comments on same. (.25)	0.75	confer	
8/11/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review revised Opposition to Motion to Strike; telephone conference with S. Lemon regarding same.	0.75	confer	
8/12/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Draft and incorporate revisions to Opposition to Motion to Strike; email correspondence regarding same.	1.50	confer	
9/17/2011	Edward Mullins	Review docket; correspond with B. Manheim on strategy.	0.30	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
9/18/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with B. Manheim on strategy.	0.10	confer	
9/19/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence from D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding strategy with J. Vail (.1); correspond with D. Hallward-Driemeier on fee local rules (.3).	0.40	confer	
9/20/2011	Edward Mullins	Prepare for meeting with clients (.3); attend meeting with same (1.0); correspond with B. Manheim on procedures (.1); review correspondence to J. Vail (.1); review correspondence from J. Vail (.1); correspond with team on same (.2).	0.30	confer	
9/22/2011	Daniel Vice	Review communications with co-counsel concerning litigation updates and strategy	0.25	confer	
10/12/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, and E.Mullins regarding State's decision to pursue summary judgment and related strategy.	0.25	confer	
10/12/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Confer with team regarding summary judgment motion in light of defendants' determination not to consent to convert PI into permanent injunction.	0.50	confer	
10/12/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Follow up with S. Lemon regarding Summary Judgment motions.	0.50	confer	
10/13/2011	Edward Mullins	Correspond with S. Lemmon regarding summary judgment motion	0.20	confer	
10/13/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Multiple emails with E. Mullins regarding application of local rules to summary judgment motions.	0.25	confer	
10/14/2011	Edward Mullins	Attend meeting with Ropes firm on strategy	1.00	confer	
10/14/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Meeting with D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, K.O'Connell, and S.Lemmon regarding strategy for summary judgment motion.	0.75	confer	
10/14/2011	Goetz, Mariel	Emails with S. Lemmon and K. O'Connell regarding case filings.	0.25	confer	
10/14/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Meet with Mr. Manheim, Mr. Mullins, Ms. Dewar, Mr. Lemmon, and Ms. O'Connell to discuss summary judgment motion.	0.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
10/14/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Attended meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier, B. Manheim, E. Mullins, E. Dewar, K. O'Connell regarding motion for summary judgment.	1.00	confer	
10/14/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Meeting with team and E. Mullins to discuss Summary Judgment Motion and next steps.	0.75	confer	
10/14/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Worked with S. Lemmon to compile relevant previous filings for drafting summary judgment motion.	0.25	confer	
10/14/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Meeting with team and local counsel to discuss motion for summary judgment strategy.	1.00	confer	
10/20/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence regarding summary judgment	0.10	confer	
10/20/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Draft correspondence to counsel for defendants regarding joint statement of undisputed facts.	0.25	confer	
10/21/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Focus on Summary Judgment motions and state response; meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier to discuss same.	0.50	confer	
10/21/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Corresponded with S. Lemmon regarding draft of motion for summary judgment.	0.25	confer	
10/24/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Reviewed draft motion for summary judgment and emails to/from D.Hallward-Driemeier and S.Lemmon regarding comments and proposed revisions to same.	1.00	confer	
10/24/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Review and provide comments on draft motion for summary judgment.	1.25	confer	
10/24/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Discussion with S. Lemmon regarding revisions to summary judgment motion and separate statement of facts.	0.25	confer	
10/25/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence regarding enlargement of time (.1); review draft of same (.1); provide comments (.1); review order granting enlargement (.1)	0.20	confer	
10/25/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Additional email correspondence relating to Summary Judgment Motion and filing Unopposed Extension Motion with Court.	0.50	confer	
10/26/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence from T. Julin regarding amicus, supplemental authority.	0.10	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
10/26/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Numerous e-mails to/from E.Mullins, D.Hallward-Driemeier, B.Manheim, K.O'Connell, and S.Lemmon regarding drafts of summary judgment brief and stipulated statement of facts and revisions thereto, potential participation of additional amici, and recently issued decision for possible inclusion in summary judgment briefing.	0.25	confer	
10/26/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence and follow up with team.	0.50	confer	
10/28/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon and E.Mullins regarding revisions to draft statement of stipulated facts; reviewed E.Mullins' revisions to same.	0.25	confer	
10/28/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review E. Mullins' edits to statement of facts; follow up with team.	0.50	confer	
10/31/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Telephone conversation with S. Lemmon regarding Summary Judgment papers and exchange of proposed joint statement with State.	0.50	confer	
11/1/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Reviewed revised proposed statement of undisputed facts; emails to/from S.Lemmon regarding same.	0.25	confer	
11/1/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Telephone conference with K. Crumbly regarding webinar for American Academy of Pediatrics.	0.75	confer	
11/3/2011	Edward Mullins	Review State's revisions to undisputed facts (.2); correspond with Ropes team on same (.5).	0.60	confer	
11/3/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Reviewed state revisions to proposed statement of stipulated facts and emails to/from E.Mullins, B.Manheim, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and S.Lemmon regarding same.	0.25	confer	
11/3/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Corresponded with team regarding government's proposed revisions to separate statement of facts.	0.75	confer	
11/4/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Email to Ropes team conveying proposed revisions to proposed statement of stipulated facts.	0.25	confer	
11/4/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Corresponded with team about the pros and cons of two separate statements of fact.	0.25	confer	
11/4/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Worked with S. Lemmon to discuss revisions to defendant's separate statement of facts and drafted same.	1.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
11/7/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence with K. Crumley regarding webinar.	0.50	confer	
11/8/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Corresponded with S. Lemmon regarding revised SSOF; aided and analyzed same.	0.25	confer	
11/9/2011	Edward Mullins	Review changes of J. Vail (.1); correspond with team regarding strategy and filing date (.2); review draft of undisputed facts, finalize same (.3).	0.20	confer	
11/9/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Reviewed opposing counsel's second round of objections to statement of undisputed facts and emails to/from B.Manheim, E.Mullins, S.Lemmon, and K.O'Connell regarding same.	0.25	confer	
11/9/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Discussed next steps for Motion for Summary Judgment with A. Ripa.	0.50	confer	
11/10/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Worked with A. Ripa regarding status of Motion for Summary Judgment, next steps.	0.75	confer	
11/10/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Worked with B. Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier, A. Ripa, K. O'Connell to edit Motion for Summary Judgment in preparation for filing on November 11, 2011.	11.50	confer	
11/10/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Revised supplemental statement of facts and corresponded with S. Lemmon regarding same; confirmed challenged provisions.	1.75	confer	
11/10/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Corresponded with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa to revise MSJ, proposed order, and SSOF; drafted revisions to same.	2.50	confer	
11/11/2011	Doug Giuliano	Confer with team on filing motion for summary judgment (0.3).	0.30	confer	
11/11/2011	Edward Mullins	Work on statement of undisputed facts (.1); correspond with S. Lemmon on procedure (.5); finalize summary judgment (.1).	0.50	confer	
11/11/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	Conferred with S.Lemmon regarding filing of motion for summary judgment and emails to/from S.Lemmon and E.Mullins regarding same.	0.25	confer	
11/14/2011	Doug Giuliano	Confer with team on defendant's filing not complying with local rules and on deadline for responding to motion for summary judgment.	0.20	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
11/14/2011	Edward Mullins	Review State's motion for summary judgment (.1); correspond with S. Lemmon about potential striking of same (.2); review motion for pages (.1); correspond with co-counsel on same (.3).	0.50	confer	
11/14/2011	Dewar, Elizabeth N.	E-mails to/from S.Lemmon, D.Hallward-Driemeier, and B.Manheim regarding defendants' motion for summary judgment and responses thereto; read defendants' submissions.	0.50	confer	
11/15/2011	Antzoulatos, Sophia	Run searches for A. Ripa for examples of Opposition to Summary Judgment Motions from SD Florida (1.0); discuss workspace issues with A. Ripa (.5)	1.50	confer	
11/15/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Correspondance with K. O'Connell, A. Ripa regarding status of response to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment and next steps.	0.50	confer	
11/15/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Work on Motion Summary Judgment issues; coordinate response.	0.50	confer	
11/15/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Analyzed Defendant's motion for summary judgment (1.0); corresponded with team regarding approach to opposition (.25); meeting with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa regarding same; (.5) began analyzing Defendant's past pleadings for inconsistencies with current motion. (.5)	0.75	confer	
11/16/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Review defendants' motion for summary judgment and statement in support. (1.0) Conversation with Mr. Ripa re same. (.5)	1.00	confer	
11/16/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Drafted email to S. Lemmon and A. Ripa summarizing inconsistencies between Defendant's pleadings (1.0); corresponded with them regarding same (.5)	1.50	confer	
11/18/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Correspondence with K. O'Connell, A. Ripa regarding status of brief and next steps.	0.75	confer	
11/18/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Meeting with A. Ripa and S. Lemmon regarding tenor of opposition, next steps, and additional research (.5); analyzed current opposition (.5)	0.50	confer	
11/23/2011	Edward Mullins	Review response to summary judgment (.2); correspond with S. Lemmon on reply to same (.1).	0.10	confer	
11/28/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Drafted email update on case for B. Manheim to send Plaintiffs.	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
11/28/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Continued analyzing case law regarding Defendant's opposition (1.5); coorespondence with S. Lemmon regarding same. (.5)	0.50	confer	
11/29/2011	Edward Mullins	Review report from B. Manheim on status of case.	0.10	confer	
11/29/2011	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Meet with team to outline revisions to opposition to defendants' summary judgment motion.	1.50	confer	
11/29/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Worked with D. Hallward-Driemeier, A. Ripa, K. O'Connell regarding status of briefing, next steps.	1.75	confer	
11/29/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Worked with A. Ripa, K. O'Connell to edit Opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	7.25	confer	
11/29/2011	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Telephone call with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding case; edit S. Lemmon's email regarding status of case and send same to client.	1.00	confer	
11/29/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Multiple emails and calls with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa on revising latest draft of opposition to Defendant's motion for summary judgment (.5); discussed action plan for reply. (.5)	1.00	confer	
11/29/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Worked with D. Hallward-Driemeier, S. Lemmon, and A. Ripa on revisions to opposition to motion for summary judgment, reply and Defendant's statement of facts.	7.25	confer	
11/30/2011	Edward Mullins	Edit and revise opposition to summary judgment (1.3); send comments to Ropes team (.2).	0.20	confer	
11/30/2011	Lemmon, Scott	Correspondence with K. O'Connell, A. Ripa regarding status of Opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.00	confer	
11/30/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Reviewed and commented on A. Ripa revisions; discussion with S. Lemmon and A. Ripa regarding same.	1.25	confer	
11/30/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Continued drafting Reply brief (2.0); drafted response to Defendant's objections to Plaintiff's supplemental statement of facts (1.0); multiple emails and calls with A. Ripa and S. Lemmon regarding same. (.75)	0.75	confer	
12/1/2011	Antzoulatos, Sophia	Discuss upcoming deadlines with A. Ripa (.25); prepare exhibits. (.75)	0.25	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
12/8/2011	Edward Mullins	Update team on recent related case filing	0.10	confer	
12/14/2011	Edward Mullins	Review correspondence regarding records statute (.1); task D. Giuliano on same (.1); work on strategy for same (.2)	0.30	confer	
12/14/2011	O'Connell, Kelly	Reviewed correspondence from clients and team regarding gun law.	0.25	confer	
3/2/2012	Edward Mullins	Correspond with T. Julin on amicus	0.10	confer	
7/2/2012	Antzoulatos, Sophia	Discuss incoming docket entries and upcoming fees filing with team.	0.25	confer	
7/2/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Reviewed opinion granting motion for summary judgment (.5); worked with team regarding motion for attorney's fees (.5); corresponded with B. Chu to receive updated expense reports (.25); reviewed previous materials to re-familiarize myself and materials to D. Cunningham. (.5)	0.75	confer	
7/3/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Prepared for and met with E. Siegle regarding motion for attorneys' fees research (1.0); analyzed R&G expenses and categorized same (1.5); began drafting outline for motion for attorneys' fees (2.25); worked with co-counsel and team regarding external and internal deadlines for same (.25); analyzed local rules and drafted chart of schedule and requirements. (.25)	1.25	confer	
7/5/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Follow up with associate on case regarding fees petition.	0.50	confer	
7/5/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Continued drafting motion for attorneys fees (2.0); meeting with E. Siegle regarding same (.25); meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding same (.25); continued analyzing expense reports for fee petition. (.5)	0.50	confer	
7/9/2012	Edward Mullins	Correspond with team on fees motion	0.30	confer	
7/9/2012	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Provide guidance to associate team regarding organization of fee petition and recoverable fees and costs.	1.00	confer	
7/9/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Meet with Doug HD, K. O'Connell regarding attorney fee petition.	0.75	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/9/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Meeting with E. Siegle regarding update on case law research and next steps (.5); continued drafting motion for attorneys' fees (2.0); meeting with E. Siegle, B. Manheim, and D. Hallward-Driemeier to discuss fee petition strategy (1.0); continued to work with E. Siegle regarding same (.25); analyzed expenses and drafted email summarizing preliminary numbers for team (1.75); email correspondence with B. Manheim regarding same. (.25)	3.75	confer	
7/10/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Meeting with team regarding fee petition.	0.50	confer	
7/10/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Analyzed research by E. Siegle regarding fee request standards; multiple emails regarding same.	0.25	confer	
7/10/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Prepared for and led meeting with E. Siegle regarding next steps and revisions to expense reports.	0.50	confer	
7/10/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Reviewed Brady project billing reports and email correspondence with B. Manheim regarding same.	0.25	confer	
7/11/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Discussion with B. Manheim and follow-up with E. Siegle regarding co-counsel expense reports.	0.50	confer	
7/11/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Drafted draft email to Brady Project for B. Manheim regarding fee petition	0.50	confer	
7/12/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence with Brady concerning attorney fee petition and revisions (.25); follow up with K. O'Connell (.5).	0.75	confer	
7/12/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review K. O'Connell email correspondence regarding attorney fee and calculation of award.	0.50	confer	
7/12/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Email correspondence with E. Davila regarding Florida fee schedules and rates and bill of costs.	0.50	confer	
7/12/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Meeting with E. Siegle on analysis of hourly reports.	0.50	confer	
7/16/2012	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Provide guidance to associate team regarding organization of fee petition and recoverable fees and costs.	0.50	confer	
7/17/2012	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Review of draft application for attorneys' fees. (.25) Meeting with Mr. Manheim and Ms. O'Connell to discuss recoverable fees and costs. (.5)	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
7/17/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Meeting with B. Manheim, D. Hallward-Driemeier, and E. Siegle regarding issues related to motion for attorneys' fees.	1.00	confer	
7/24/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Drafted email to team regarding motion for attorneys fees and all drafted exhibits for review.	0.25	confer	
7/24/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Corresponded with E. Siegle and E. Mullins regarding bill of costs requirements and procedures.	0.50	confer	
7/25/2012	Edward Mullins	Review motion for fees (.2); correspond with team on same (.2); work with K. O'Connell on same (.1)	0.30	confer	
7/25/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Correspond with B. Chu, E. Siegle, and E. Davila on receiving updated costs and drafted related forms and pleadings.	0.75	confer	
7/27/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence with clients; review draft statement regarding fees for public interest work.	0.50	confer	
7/30/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence with team regarding fee petition.	0.50	confer	
7/30/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Emailed co-counsel and team draft Bill of Costs and next steps.	0.25	confer	
7/30/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Emails with team and co-counsel with revised motion, bill of costs, and declarations for review.	0.25	confer	
7/30/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Revised and finalized motion for attorneys fees and all eight supporting exhibits and served on opposing counsel (.3.0); drafted memorandum in support of bill of costs (.25); worked with local counsel to file same (.25); emails with J. Vail regarding bill of costs (.25); multiple emails and calls with team and co-counsel regarding issues about same (1.75); emailed draft motion and supporting documents to J. Vail. (.25)	2.00	confer	
7/31/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Multiple emails between B. Manheim, E. Mullins, and D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding request for extension and electronic documents.	0.25	confer	
8/1/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Email correspondence and meeting with K O'Connell regarding state request for electronic records.	0.50	confer	
8/1/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Drafted and reviewed multiple emails with B. Manheim and J. Vail regarding extension and electronic documents	0.50	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
8/7/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Discussion with B. Manheim regarding correspondence and call with J. Vail.	0.25	confer	
8/9/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Emails with local counsel and team regarding call and article about judge.	0.25	confer	
8/16/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Follow-up correspondence with K. O'Connell re fee dispute issues	0.75	confer	
8/22/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding judge's order; email to team regarding same.	0.25	confer	
9/17/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding response to fee petition; reviewed email correspondence from co-counsel and attached website.	0.25	confer	
9/18/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Meet with D. Hallward Driemeir and K. O'Connell to discuss fee petition.	0.25	confer	
9/18/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Fee petition conference with K. O'Connell.	0.50	confer	
9/18/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Reviewed docket regarding extension and researched filing deadlines; emailed D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding same.	0.25	confer	
9/18/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Meeting with D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim to discuss strategy for meet and confer with government.	1.00	confer	
9/19/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Multiple emails with B. Dewar and M. Goetz regarding schedule and billing practices for fee petition.	0.25	confer	
9/20/2012	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Prepare for and participate in meeting to confer with counsel for defendants regarding fee application.	0.75	confer	
9/20/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Meet and confer regarding fee petition with K. O'Connell.	0.50	confer	
9/27/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Corresponded with M. Goetz and B. Dewar regarding motion for attorneys' fee revisions.	0.25	confer	
9/30/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Circulated objections to team for review and revisions.	0.25	confer	
10/1/2012	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Discuss with Ms. O'Connell revisions to fee request in light of state's objections.	0.25	confer	
10/1/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Call with A. Ripa to discuss revisions to billing entries.	0.25	confer	

EXHIBIT 4

Wollschlaeger v. Farmer

ATTORNEY CONFERENCES, COMMUNICATIONS

Date	Timekeeper	Legal Services Rendered	Hours	Notes	
10/1/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Meeting with D. Hallward-Drimeier regarding status of fee petition objections, strategy for meet and confer, and timeline.	0.25	confer	
10/5/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Meet and confer with State, D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim (.5); follow-up meeting with team (.5); follow-up email with J. Vail circulating revised chart (.25).	1.25	confer	
10/10/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Follow up with team on attorney fee petition issues.	0.50	confer	
10/11/2012	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Confer with Mr. Mullins regarding fee application.	0.25	confer	
10/31/2012	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Confer with Ms. O'Connell regarding revisions to motion for attorneys fees.	0.25	confer	
10/31/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding revisions to draft motion for attorneys' fees.	0.25	confer	
10/31/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Reviewed email from opposing counsel regarding meet and confer; drafted follow-up email to opposing counsel regarding same.	0.25	confer	
11/6/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Multiple emails with D. Hallward-Driemeier and B. Manheim regarding strategy regarding same (.5); Revised motion for attorneys' fees in light of meet and confer (1.75).	0.50	confer	
11/19/2012	Manheim, Bruce S Jr	Review attorney fee petition and briefs (.25); drafted email to team regarding same. (.25)	0.50	confer	
11/20/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Multiple emails with co-counsel regarding revisions to motion and exhibits (.25); revised motions per communications with co-counsel. (1.0)	1.25	confer	
11/28/2012	Hallward-Driemeier, Douglas	Confer with Ms. O'Connell regarding revisions to motion for attorneys fees.	0.25	confer	
11/29/2012	O'Connell, Kelly	Discussion with D. Hallward-Driemeier regarding fee motion.	0.25	confer	
			423.30		